Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 June 2023 10:52 AM
To: alicechau@kanfs.net

Cc: Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLQ7037S (OD) - Finalization
Dear Alice,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $3,928.90 before excess $500.00 & GST with 6 days of repair, subject
to their approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>
Sent: Friday, May 19, 2023 5:42 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SLQ7037S (OD) - Finalization

Dear Sir,

With reference to the mentioned vehicle, please confirm and finalise.
Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006



