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Winnie Foo (LKKAuto)

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 March 2023 2:14 pm
To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Swee Peng (LKKAuto); Jie Hua FAN (SPF); 

Winnie Foo (LKKAuto); Accounts (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013

Hir Sir, 
 
              PO. 6000128622. 
 
Best regards, 
 
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 

    
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
 

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 March 2023 1:56 pm 
To: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng 
(LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Jie Hua FAN (SPF) <FAN_Jie_Hua@spf.gov.sg>; Winnie Foo (LKKAuto) 
<winniefoo@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
 
Hello IO Jun Hao 
 
May I have the PO number from your side, for us to key into our system? 
 

Best Regards, 

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 

 LKK Auto Consultants 

Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 15 March 2023 10:46 am 
To: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang 
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Jie Hua FAN (SPF) 
<FAN_Jie_Hua@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013  
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  

Once the report is ready, please ‘Attn’ the invoice to ‘Lee Jun Hao’, Central Police Division, Singapore Police 
Force. We are expecting the report to be delivered by April 2023. Thank you. 
  
Best regards, 
  
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 

    
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
  
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
  

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF)  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 March 2023 2:42 pm 
To: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; 'Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)' <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang 
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Jie Hua FAN (SPF) 
<FAN_Jie_Hua@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
              I refer to the vehicle inspection report as discussed below. Is the invoice for the report ready? I require it to 
settle the payment on my end. Thank you. 
  
Best regards, 
  
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 
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Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
  
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
  

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 1:36 pm 
To: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang 
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Jie Hua FAN (SPF) 
<FAN_Jie_Hua@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Hello IO Jun Hao 
  

I refer to your request below. 

  

We will carry out a mechanical inspection for any abnormality to the Prime Mover. A report of our 
findings will be put up thereafter for your further action.  

  

Our fee is $700/- (excluding gst). 

Best Regards, 
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 
LKK Auto Consultants 
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

  

  
  

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 11:58 am 
To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang 
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Jie Hua FAN (SPF) 
<FAN_Jie_Hua@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Dear Sir, 
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              May I check how much the report will cost? Is there a quotation? Thank you. 
  
Best regards, 
  
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 

    
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
  
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
  

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 6:47 pm 
To: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang 
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Hello IO Jun Hao  
  
This is the latest of our contract with SPF, 
 
TENDER NO. MHA00003000010558 
  
LETTER OF ACCEPTANCE NO. MHA00004000006777 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 
LKK Auto Consultants 
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 1:12 pm 
To: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Hello IO Jun Hao 
  
We will be forwarding this email to my accounts side, and they will provide you with what you need and you can 
communicate with them as well. 
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Best Regards, 

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 

 LKK Auto Consultants 

Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF) <LEE_Jun_Hao@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 12:27 pm 
To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Sir, 
  
              I refer to the preceding e-mail. Thank you. 
  
Best regards, 
  
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 

    
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
  
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
  

From: Jun Hao LEE (SPF)  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 10:58 am 
To: 'sherwin@lkkauto.com' <sherwin@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Vehicle Inspection Report A/20230131/0013 
  
Dear Sir, 
  
              We spoke. Please assist to provide your DA contract number to me so that we can process payment for your 
report for the vehicle inspection of the above case. 
  
2            Thank you. 
  
Best regards, 
  
Lee Jun Hao 
Investigation Officer 
General Investigation Squad 1 | Investigation Branch 
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Central Division 
DID: (65) 6557 5042 | HP: (65) 9620 3610 

    
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
  
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 
  


