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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 4:15 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: Our Ref: 23/23/23/VC05/027130  ll   OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured 

GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023

Lonpac External - General 

 

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

Please refer to the subject title for our claim no. 

 

Thanks 

 

 

Huey Ni 

 

 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 3:58 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Kindly provide us claim no. 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 2:15 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of GBF 6351S.  

Repairer was unable to undertake within the neG value $15,000.00, vehicle recommended total loss. 
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Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 20 March 2023 10:57 AM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>; SUR 

<sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

 

Dear Michelle, 

 

Noted, we will arrange survey accordingly. 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Monday, 20 March 2023 10:06 AM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com> 

Subject: FW: OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023 

Importance: High 

 

Lonpac External - General 

 

Our Ref: TBA 

 
Dear Meng Yan, 

 
Please proceed to survey and revert.  
 

We shall advise the excess in due course. 
 

 
 
 

Best Regards 
 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
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Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 

practices. 

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>  

Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 9:43 AM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: OD Claim - Our Ref: GBF6351S; Your Insured GBF6351S DOA 16/03/2023 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Sirs, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Attached for OD Claim. 

Kindly revert asap. 

 

Please note that vehicle has been towed in to our premises.  Kindly arrange for physical 

survey asap. 
 

Thanks. 

 
Best regards,  

Michelle Ong 

Service Consultant 

Bodyshop & Paint  

 

 

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.  

249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 9129 4556  F (65) 6264 7137    

www.wearnes.com      michelle.ong@wearnes.com  
  

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

 

 

 


