










TAX INVOICE

Date of Request: 06/03/2023
Your Ref No: SNJ2965J

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date of Accident: 01/03/2023 00:00 (SGT)
Vehicle No: SNJ2965J
Place of Accident: Singapore

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident report as requested:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S$) QTY AMOUNT (S$)

GBG9348C Singapore (31.00 ) 1 (28.70 )

GST Amount (2.30 )

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) (31.00 )

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank you.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 April 2023 2:29 PM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving 

SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 
HOURS

Dear Sirs, 
 
For an update, we have settled the matter at $6,871.00(all-in). 
                                      

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,480.00 
2. Loss of Use (4days x $90.00) $    360.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $      31.00 

Total $ 6,871.00 
 
We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant document to your good office once it is ready. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 10:07 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C 
ON 01/03/2023 ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
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Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2023 5:35 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 
01/03/2023 ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
 
Your ref: 23/23/23/VC05/027055 
Our ref : CC4/LPC23002806/Upa3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG9348C(LONPAC) AND SNJ2965J(TP) ON 01/03/2023 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “Revo Performance Pte Ltd" at $6,911.00(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (with 8% GST) $ 20,740.86 $ 6,480.00 ($6,000.00 + 8% GST) 
2. Loss of USE (4days x $120.00) $      480.00 $     400.00 (4days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE $        31.00 $      31.00 

Total $ 21,251.86 $ 6,911.00 
   
Surveyor recommended 4days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 24/04/2023 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, March 17, 2023 10:00 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 
ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Friday, 17 March 2023 6:44 AM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 
ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Meng Yan, 
 
FYNA. Attached copy of insured report. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 16, 2023 6:07 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 
ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
 

Dear Officer-In-Charge, 

  

Good day. 

  

We would like to appoint Marcus Chua (LKK) for our client's SNJ2965J pre-repair survey. 

 

 

Thanks & Regards 

Joey Chong 

 
Revo Performance Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit) 
Tel :    (65) 6745 6706 
Fax :   (65) 6484 3653 
www.revoperformance.com.sg 
 
Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email. 
 
NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely 
for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the 
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this 
message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not 
of an official nature shall not be deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message. 
Revo Performance Pte Ltd 
Reg No. 201200256H 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 11:57 PM 
To: revoperformance@hotmail.com <revoperformance@hotmail.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: OREEF : 23/23/23/VC05/027055 FW: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 ALONG 
TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS  
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Lonpac External - General 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
  
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose our list of Motor 
surveyors your attention:- 
  

1 Jackson Quek –Appraisal   
2 Nicholas Tey -Appraisal  
3 Adrian Lim - LKK 
4 Marcus Chua -LKK 
5 Kenneth Kong – LKK 
6 Mohd Nazril – LKK 
7 Mohd Taufik – LKK 
8 Adrian Ling – LKK 
9 Mohd Rasul – LKK 

10 Simon Ho- LKK 
  
Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days. 
  
  
Best Regards 
  
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 4:38 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Accident Involving SNJ2965J And GBG9348C ON 01/03/2023 ALONG TAMPINES AVE 10 ABOUT 0915 HOURS 
  

Dear Officer-In-Charge, 

  

Good day. 

  

Please send a surveyor down our workshop regarding as below. 
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We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident on 01/03/2022 at about 0915 hours, 

along TAMPINES AVE 10 involving our client’s SNJ2965J and GBG9348C driven by your insured or your insured’s 

authorized driver at the material time. 

  

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client / we proceed to repair 

the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or 

your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you 

within the stipulated timeline, our client / we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference 

to you. 

  

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at : 

  

Name of workshop : REVO PERFORMANCE PTE LTD 

  

Address : 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

                  #02-51/53 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

                  Singapore 417883 

  

Contact Person : Joey Chong  86001554 / Benjamin Yu 92378224 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Joey Chong 

 
Revo Performance Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit) 
Tel :    (65) 6745 6706 
Fax :   (65) 6484 3653 
www.revoperformance.com.sg 



7

 
Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email. 
 
NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely 
for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the 
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this 
message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not 
of an official nature shall not be deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message. 
Revo Performance Pte Ltd 
Reg No. 201200256H 

  
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


