Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 June 2023 10:00 AM

To: Thiam Heng Huat; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: YOUR INSURED: SML8691K (GRAB) OUR REF: SLV3121G DOA: 13.03.23 *** LKK
REF: CC4/GRB23002805/Kpa3

Attachments: Invoice SLV3121G.pdf; ITNET-00000-230315-003381_230315_164805.pdf; LOA.pdf;

Car Rental.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HT,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 4:54 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: YOUR INSURED: SML8691K (GRAB) OUR REF: SLV3121G DOA: 13.03.23

Dear Claims Team,

We refer to the above mentioned.

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search receipt, car rental, LOA and below are the items our
client wish to claim from IIl.

1. Repair costs $ 9,504.00
2. Car rental 600.00
3. Loss of use for 7 days 1,050.00
4. LTA search fee 26.75

$11,180.75

We look forward to an early settlement.



Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295



