Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 3:39 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; admin-d

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMS 9882 H & YOUR INSURED SMN 1010 L ON
13/3/2023 - KS

Attachments: PA02732023 - SMS 9882 H - AUDI A6 1.8 TFSI S-TRONIC - FRONT - AIG (TP).pdf;
9882.pdf

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached above is the Estimate and Search Result for your kind reference.
Kindly assist follow up direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

En Qi Lim

Claims Adminstrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Engineered to
Exhll.arate.
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FIND OUT MORE

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 March 2023 3:51 PM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMS 9882 H & YOUR INSURED SMN 1010 L ON 13/3/2023 - KS

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above.

Please provide us search result for SMN 1010 L.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 March 2023 2:44 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMS 9882 H & YOUR INSURED SMN 1010 L ON 13/3/2023 - KS

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We are in the opinion that our client is not the
proximate cause of the accident.

Therefore, we propose for direct settlement at 100% liability clearance in our clients favour.
Please advise who the officer in-charge we shall liaise with.

Attached are the GIA report for your reference and we will send you the estimate once it is ready.
Survey TBC.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

En Qi Lim

Claims Adminstrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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Email Disclaimer



This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you



