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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 4 April 2023 10:41 AM
To: ying; SUR
Cc: Edward Lim (LKK Auto)
Subject: SKG3568S PENDING FOR FINALISE
Attachments: 3955_001.pdf

Dear Ying, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1,600.00/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: ying <ying@smemotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 9:18 AM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SKG3568S PENDING FOR FINALISE 
 

Hi, 

 

Please check and confirm. 

 

thanks & regards 

YING 

 
 
-------- Forwarded Message --------  
Subject: Attached Image 

Date: Tue, 4 Apr 2023 09:10:12 +0800 
From: ptr2@smemotor.com.sg 

To: sme ying <ying@smemotor.com.sg>
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