Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Sarah Ong <sarah@dingautomotive.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 June 2023 9:03 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kelly Ding; Motor Claims; Admin A

Subject: [Signed DV & Invoice] 50114927 / SHB4891M & SNB1732M (DOA: 12/03/2023) ***
LKK REF: CC4/GRB23002663/Rpa3

Attachments: SHB4891M SIGNED DV & INV.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please find the attached signed DV and Tax Invoice for your payment processing.

Kindly direct all cheque payments to our new mailing address below.

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
2 Pereira Road
#04-02, 2Connectt@TS

Singapore 368024

Please Cc: kelly@dingautomotive.com, claims@dingautomotive.com in all correspondence.

Thanks & regards,

Sarah

Claims Dept.

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

2 Pereira Road | #04-02, 2Connectt@TS | Singapore 368024

T: (+65) 9239 4128 | E: sarah@dingautomotive.com

On Wed, 14 Jun 2023 at 12:22, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



