Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 31 July 2023 9:45 AM

To: Jenn

Cc: Florence Tee; claim@convinceauto.com.sg; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Finalized invoice for XB7882E

Hi Jenn,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $6,900.00 /- with 06 days of
repair before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Ky Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Jenn <jenn@convinceauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 31 July 2023 9:18 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Florence Tee <florence@convinceauto.com.sg>; claim@convinceauto.com.sg <claim@convinceauto.com.sg>
Subject: Finalized invoice for XB7882E

Good morning, Rasul.

We have attached the finalized invoice for your reference and action.

Thank yow & Best Regards,

Jenmnifer Hee

Rental Manager
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Convince Auto Pte Ltd

Convince Engineering Pte Ltd
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