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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 5 July 2023 5:26 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR
Cc: AutoInsure
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OUR REF CM433 SLV7336C TP CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE

Dear Shiau Chan ,  
 
We confirm COR $6352.18 and 5 repair days.  
 
Thanks  
Meihong 
 
 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 1:33 PM 
To: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OUR REF CM433 SLV7336C TP CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
Dear Mei Hong, Without prej udi ce We will be advisi ng our pri ncipal a cost of repair of $6,3 52. 18 before GST with 5 days of repair, subje ct to their appr oval. Best Regards, Shiau Cha n (Ms) | Case Ha ndler LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Phone : 6256 -35 61  
 

Dear Mei Hong, 
 
Without prejudice 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $6,352.18 before GST with 5 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 4:14 PM 
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OUR REF CM433 SLV7336C TP CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
Hi Shiau Chan,  
 
We don’t have dismantle photo.  
 
Thanks  
Meihong 
 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 3:38 PM 
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To: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OUR REF CM433 SLV7336C TP CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
Dear Mei Hong, Have any di sma ntle phot os of SLV 7336 C? Be st Regards, S hiau Chan (M s) | Ca se Handler LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Phone: 62 56-3561 | e mail: siews c@ lkkauto.  com | fax: 625 6-4 315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi I ndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0 2-2 5  
 

Dear Mei Hong, 
 
Have any dismantle photos of SLV 7336C? 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 12:36 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: RE: RE: OUR REF CM433 SLV7336C TP CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
 
 
Dear  Shiau Chen,  
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We attached herewith after paint photos for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your confirmation finalised amount soon. 

Thank You. 
 
Regards 
Meihong 
 
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628 
mobile: (65) 9743 6363 
e: meihong.lim@autoinsure.com.sg 
 
 


