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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 June 2023 3:28 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Jia Yu'

Subject: RE: SLR8042P

Attachments: SLR8042P Mazda 3 2017 OD Allianz.pdf

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

Confirm, Thank you. 

 

Best Regard's 

Billy Liaw 

 

MOVA Automo"ve Pte Ltd 

Tel: +65 62723892 

Fax: +65 62708314 

 

 

 

Connect with us on  

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 2:08 PM 

To: billy@mova.com.sg 

Subject: RE: SLR8042P 

 

Dear Billy, 

 

Without prejudice 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump sum $4,300.00 before excess $500.00 and GST with 9 days 

of repair , subject to their approval. 

 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 9:53 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SLR8042P 

 

 

 

 

________________________________________ 

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg> 
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Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 9:52:28 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: SLR8042P 

 

Hi Sir, 

 

 

 

ALach with Finaliza"on Report, Please advise. Thank you. 

 

Best Regard's 

Billy Liaw 

 

MOVA Automo"ve Pte Ltd 

Tel: +65 62723892 

Fax: +65 62708314 

 

 

 


