Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 August 2023 4:02 PM

To: fcautogarage pte Itd

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: NTUC-TP GBH 6536R DOA: 02/03/2023

Dear Florence,
Without prejudice
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $4,700.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly send the relevant documents to NTUC insurance company.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: fcautogarage pte Itd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2023 11:32 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NTUC-TP GBH 6536R DOA: 02/03/2023

Dear Shiau,

We would like to counter propose lump sum @5$4700.00.
Thank you

On Tue, Aug 1, 2023 at 11:09 AM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Florence,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $4,600.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.



Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee

Claim Officer

+65 90110243



