Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 June 2023 4:31 PM
To: Sam San Joi UBI; SUR
Subject: RE: FINALIZE SNB7845G
Dear Sam,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $18,069.46 before GST with 7 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2023 11:09 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALIZE SNB7845G



