
TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10020773 /JY || OI- SKD3017G (Grey) TP-SMP4339J
|| Est: $0.00 || Optima Werkz PL

Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Thu 2/3/2023 1<54 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Teo Jie
Yang <jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

1 attachments (3 MB)

C10020773 - TP (SMP4339J).zip;

 
Hi Team,
 
We would like to request TP survey for SMP4339J.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
 
Workshop information:
Address:      

 
Please confirm assignment. 
 
Thank you.
 
Warmest Regards,
 
Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims
 
 
T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853 
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
239924                                                                                                                       

mailto:frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as
Budget Direct Insurance.
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate
(Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and
attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto &
General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not
the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

 
 
 
 
 
From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 2 March 2023 12:14 pm
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Cc: Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An
<tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Victor Seng
<victor.seng@ow.sg>
Subject: RE: PRI Request on 02.03.2023 || C10020773/JY || PRI - SMP4339J CLAIMING
AGAINST SKD3017G (AGI), DOA: 28/02/2023
 
Dear Motor Claims Department,
 
We appointed LKK.
Kindly advise on the OIC.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
 
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.)
Motor Claims Executive
Office : (+65) 6481 1522
 

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz
 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy,
distribute or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email
in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.
 
From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 2 March 2023 10:51 am

https://www.budgetdirect.com.sg/?utm_source=signature&utm_medium=email&utm_term=bdi_e-signature_all_homepage_1x1&utm_campaign=email
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https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.ow.sg%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cclaims%40budgetdirect.com.sg%7C559c866ab28947cbe6d108db1ad49f74%7C30481a8fb7224e2f8cfe9fd64ae30761%7C1%7C0%7C638133272751331036%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=HjGMz3WXUusxR4MQ07LTbdhsjt9pezWoEhFipyAopvg%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.facebook.com%2FOptimaWerkz&data=05%7C01%7Cclaims%40budgetdirect.com.sg%7C559c866ab28947cbe6d108db1ad49f74%7C30481a8fb7224e2f8cfe9fd64ae30761%7C1%7C0%7C638133272751331036%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=H2%2FUSw87Mr%2FbJ7BtjOxkrKvtzkRdO9jg8u6QJPlgqUk%3D&reserved=0
mailto:kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg


To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Cc: Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An
<tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Victor Seng
<victor.seng@ow.sg>
Subject: PRI - SMP4339J CLAIMING AGAINST SKD3017G (AGI), DOA: 28/02/2023
 
Dear Motor Claims Department,
 
Kindly arrange PRI at 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A #01-05 AMK Autopoint S568047.
 
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
 
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.)
Motor Claims Executive
Office : (+65) 6481 1522
 

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz
 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy,
distribute or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email
in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.
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