Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, February 28, 2023 4:59 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: Re: Plse arrange PRI for bike FBJ 7104L as per attached
Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 4:38 PM

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: Re: Plse arrange PRI for bike FBJ 7104L as per attached

Internal

Your ref: FBJ 7104L

Our ref: 2023 32005583SL-SJK747C

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1

Singapore 569622
Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64524868

Thank you.



Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQL | Altianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralympic Posbner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 28, 2023 12:25 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Cc: sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] Re: Plse arrange PRI for bike FBJ 7104L as per attached

Dear Sir/Madam

Please find the attached GIA for your reference.

Thank You

Regards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64524868

On Tuesday, 28 February 2023 at 12:13:53 pm SGT, Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam

Please find the attached LTA for your reference. GIA not ready yet.

Thank You

Regards



Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64524868

On Friday, 24 February 2023 at 09:55:30 pm SGT, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
wrote:

Internal

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, February 24, 2023 4:57 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg
Subject: [EXT] Plse arrange PRI for bike FBJ 7104L as per attached

Attn: Motor Claims Dept



Plse arrange PRI for bike FBJ 7104L as per attached

Thank You

Regards

Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64524868



