Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 August 2023 9:36 AM

To: Carrine Leong

Cc: '‘Boo seng yak'; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; '‘Chang Chee Sing’; Shiau Chan
(LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINAL REVISION - SNA9326E - OD AIG - SURVEYED 1 MAR 23

Hi Carrine,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $14,774.00 /- with 06 days of repair
before GST, after excess subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ES i Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 July 2023 5:22 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>;
'Chang Chee Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SNA9326E - OD AIG - SURVEYED 1 MAR 23

Hi Rasul,

Reminder - Urgent basis please — Owner is chasing for close case

We have yet receive your confirmation of repair cost and days of repair for above vehicle.
Pls confirm repair cost of $14,714.00 @ 6 days exclude 1 Sunday.

We sincerely appreciate your early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong



Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 %223

Ampin |

the adrenaline.

The new Audi e-tron S Sportbadic

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 28 March 2023 4:54 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine
Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SNA9326E - OD AIG - SURVEYED 1 MAR 23

Hi Rasul and all,
Revised estimate, photos attached.
Pls confirm repair cost of $14,714.00 @ 6 days exclude 1 Sunday.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



