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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Foo Ai Ngoh <aingoh.foo@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 4:24 PM
To: Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: ERGO - OD SLG 8833G DOA 10/02/2023- EGI REF: CDMPG23000382

Dear Xinyu 
We have no objection to Cost + 10 since it is in line with our authorized workshop;  Please check the parts price 
though.  We don’t want the case where the prices are out of range.  
 
Marcus should be able to help. 
 
Thanking you 
Ai Ngoh 
 
 
 
 

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 4:07 pm 
To: Foo Ai Ngoh <aingoh.foo@ergo.com.sg> 
Subject: ERGO - OD SLG 8833G DOA 10/02/2023- EGI REF: CDMPG23000382 
 

Dear Ai Ngoh, 
 
Kindly check & confirm that could the Repairer use the List Price for SLG 8833G. 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Xin Yu | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

EMAIL DISCLAIMER 
The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, 
distribute, act in reliance on or commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended 
recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by replying to the email and destroy any electronic or 
paper copy of this message. 
Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not 
represent, warrant or guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication 
is free of errors, virus or interference. 
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced 
by any process or for any purpose without prior written permission. 

 You don't often get email from xinyu@lkkauto.com. Learn why this is important  


