Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 March 2023 10:15 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team

Subject: Re: Photos After Repair SJIG3540H

Morning Veron,
Agree with your finalize amount.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,

disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your
system. Thank you.

On Tue, Mar 7, 2023 at 3:00 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Celia,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $750/- with 2 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 11:23 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Photos After Repair SJG3540H

From: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 11:22:22 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Photos After Repair SIG3540H

Dear Taufikh,

Kindly refer to photos after repair and pls finalize.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723



Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your
system. Thank you.



