Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: charles tan <charles-f-1@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 10 June 2023 5:19 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLB5512D / MFL2023D0002599-DOA: 25/02/2023
Ok accept.

Sent from Mail for Windows

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 8:43 AM

To: charles-f-1@hotmail.com

Subject: RE: SLB5512D / MFL2023D0002599-DOA: 25/02/2023

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Any updates?

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 9:02 AM

To: charles-f-1@hotmail.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SLB5512D / MFL2023D0002599-DOA: 25/02/2023

Dear Charles,
Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $5,331.28 before GST with 3 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




