Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 July 2023 11:40 AM

To: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: ALLIANZ-SJQ316G BMS2023/07/PD0689/DS(SM) (SLC8569R)

DOA: 22.02.2023

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$3,195.31(all in) in full
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their
insured arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process
payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 22 FEB 2023.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, July 4, 2023 3:18 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: ALLIANZ-SJQ316G BMS2023/07/PD0689/DS(SM) (SLC8569R) DOA: 22.02.2023

Hi Sir/Madam,
We refer to the attach reference.

Please find attached a copy of our letter of demand for your kind perusal.
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We would appreciate if you could revert us with your offer soonest.
Thank you and awaiting for your favorable reply.

Best Regards,
ANGELA TAN
TPR Team

DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1885 | FAX +65 6872 7260

EMAIL: Angela.Tan@inchcapemotors.com.sg

Inchcape — Borneo Motors | No. 2 Pandan Crescent Singapore 128462
www.borneomotors.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg

N7,

TOYOTA

Toyota. Always Better.
www.borneomotors.com.sg | www.lexus.com.sg

Be a fan on our Facebook page and follow us at @Lexus SG on Twitter.

Important: This e-mail and all information contained in or attached to it (the "Information"), is for information
purposes only, may be confidential and/or legally privileged and is the intellectual property of one of the
companies of the Inchcape group ("Inchcape") or third parties. Access to the Information by anyone other
than the intended recipient is unauthorised and any disclosure, copying or redistribution is prohibited and
may be unlawful. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and
permanently delete the message and any attachments or copies. Inchcape may monitor all e-mail activity
and content in accordance with UK legislation, to maintain system performance and appropriate business
usage. The contents of this email may also need to be disclosed under data protection legislation. E-mail
transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or free from errors, omissions, viruses or unforeseen
delay. Inchcape accepts no responsibility for any such errors, omissions, viruses or delays, and you are
advised to carry out your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before
relying on it for any purpose. To the extent that this e-mail is not an official communication of Inchcape, the
sender is acting neither as an agent, representative nor in any other capacity for or on behalf of Inchcape.

Inchcape PLC is registered in England No. 609782 with its registered office at 22a St. James's Square,
London, SW1Y 5LP. Version 13



