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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 June 2023 10:39 am
To: Amanda Ang
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / BANK DETAILS / OFFER /ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV636U & S1815CD 

ON 22/02/2023 | YOUR REF: CC4/AIS23002090/ya3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Amanda, 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$5,984.94 (all in) in full and final 
settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured arising out 
of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / Warrant to 
Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or 
our insured as a result of the accident on 22-February-2023.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
*Kindly provide bank details to us.   
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
 
is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not 
the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and 
notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
 
 

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, June 5, 2023 2:27 PM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER /ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV636U & S1815CD ON 22/02/2023 | YOUR REF: CC4/AIS23002090/ya3 
 
Dear Ezlyna,  
 
We refer to your email of 01/06/2023.  
 
We write to confirm settlement of $5,984.94, please send us your DV soon.  
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Thank you.  
 
 
Regards, 
Amanda Ang 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2023 3:07 PM 
To: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER /ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV636U & S1815CD ON 22/02/2023 | YOUR REF: CC4/AIS23002090/ya3 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Amanda, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have our principal’s instruction to offer as follows: 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) Part By Part $ 5,444.94 
2. Loss of Rental (5 days x $100) w/GST $    540.00 

Total $ 5,984.94 
 
Kindly confirm acceptance & E-voucher will follow shortly.  Thank you 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 6:14 PM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV636U & S1815CD ON 22/02/2023 | YOUR REF: CC4/AIS23002090/ya3 
 

Dear Sirs, 

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT CLAIM (By email only) 

We refer to the above.  

Please find LOD attached for your kind attention.  

Thank you.  

  



3

Best regards, 
Amanda Ang 
Meredes-Benz Body Care & Repair  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore 
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378 
T: +65 6206 1818 ∙ DID: +65 6771 4304   
www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  
  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the 
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are 
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its 
related corporations.  
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 11:03 AM
To: youngkim0118@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING S1815CD (ALLIANZ) AND SKV636U AT/ALONG SAIBOO STREET 

TURN LEFT TO HAVELOCK ROAD ON 22/02/2023

Dear Kim Young Jun, 
 
You Ref: S1815CD 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS23002090/ya3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S1815CD (ALLIANZ) AND SKV636U AT/ALONG SAIBOO STREET TURN LEFT TO HAVELOCK ROAD 
ON 22/02/2023 
 
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SKV636U against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver's favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of 
this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If 
you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please 
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by hand to Allianz 
Customer Care Centre. 
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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