JUZZPERFGRMANCE

Company Reg. No: 201534963C GST Reg. No: 201534963C
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-51/52

Singapore 415875

Email: admin@juzzperformance.com.sg

Email: anwar@juzzperformance.com.sg

Attn : Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Address : 300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Date: 29 March 2023

LETTER OF DEMAND

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT CLAIM FOR VEHICLE NO.: SJE298M

No. Description Amount
1 Lum Sum Repair $10,260.00
2 Loss Of Use for 4 Days ($110 per day ) S 440.00

Total Amount: $ 10,700.00

With regards to the vehicle claim referenced above, | hope this letter can be accepted as the
final repair bill.

We hereby submit the enclosed by Juzz Performance Pte Ltd with the final amount of SGD
$10,700.00 for the total repair cost including the cost of loss of use.

Thank you.
Yours Faithfully

Authorized Signatory


mailto:admin@juzzperformance.com.sg

JUZZPERFGRMANCE

.Co. Reg. No: 201534963C GST Reg. No: 201534963C
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

#03-51/52 PREMIER @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Date " 123/02/2023

Vehicle No. : SIE298M
Date of Accident :21/02/2023

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

|, ZULKIFLI BIN AHMAD , IC No.: $7248639J , owner of vehicle No.: SIE298M hereby authorized

my preferred workshop, Juzz Performance Pte Ltd , Co Reg: 201534963C, to settle the claim on

my behalf for the abovementioned accident.

Thank you.

Yours Faithfully

Name: ZULKIFLI BIN AHMAD



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO :22/23/23/VC05/027017
DATE : 06 June 2023

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, ZULKIFLI BIN AHMAD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SJE298M the sum of Singapore Dollar Ten
Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Only ($10,660.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident involving SJE298M and GBD3417S on 21/02/2023 along/at Killney Road
Towards PIE (Near Killney Road Post Office).

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ D-TECH SOLUTIONS PTE LTD AND/OR ISLAM MOHAMMAD
SAIFUL against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons
on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to “JUZZ
PERFORMANCE PTE LTD”.

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

* 7 JUNE 2023

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

ZULKIFLI BIN AHMAD / 7 JUNE 2023

Name of vehicle owner /Date


Hanis Khairil Anwar
ZULKIFLI BIN AHMAD / 7 JUNE 2023

Hanis Khairil Anwar
7 JUNE 2023


JUZZPERFGRMANCE

Co. Reg. No: 201534963C  GST Reg. No: 201534963C TAX INVOICE
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-51/52 Invoice No : 20230303
Singapore 415875 Date :29/03/2023

Email: admin@juzzperformance.com.sg

Bill To  :Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Address :300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Vehicle No : SIE298M

Vehicle Model : BMW X3

Chassis No : WBATR12090LS31271
Mileage :-
TAX INVOICE
No. Description Amount
1 Lum Sum Repair $9,500.00
Sub-Total: $9,500.00
GST 8%: $760.00
Total Amount: $ 10,260.00
Issued by:

Juzz Performance Pte Ltd

Authorized Signatory



EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 June 2023 4:22 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: OREF: 22/23/23/VC05/027017 - FW: {SEEK MANDATE} - Accident Involving

GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3

Dear Gerald,

We refer to your approval as per your email below.

We will offer TP & submit document for payment in due course. Thank you.
*Corrected TP WS name: JUZZ PERFORMANCE PTE LTD.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 4:10 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: OREF: 22/23/23/VC05/027017 - FW: {SEEK MANDATE} - Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb
2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Ezlyna.

Please proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 9:32 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE:{SEEK MANDATE} - Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023 *** LKK REF:
CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3

Dear Gerald,
Your Ref: 22/23/23/VC05/027017
We refer to the above matter and your email below.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD3417S AND SJE298M ON 21.02.2023

We have highlighted to your good office on 22/02/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It is an accident under BOLA 27, Ol rear ended TP.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer Juzz Performance Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $21,877.00 $10,260.00
2. Loss of Use (4 days x $110) S 440.00 S 400.00 (4 days x $100)
Total $22,317.00 $10,660.00

*4 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 06/06/2023 is only for mandate purpose.

The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, February 26, 2023 4:30 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3

Hi
NEW CASE

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, February 24, 2023 8:04 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref: 22/23/23/VC05/027017
Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, February 24, 2023 7:57 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23002057/Uya3
3




Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Lyna.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2023 10:45 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023

Dear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 February 2023 4:06 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Hanis <hanis@juzzperformance.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Accident Involving GBD3417S & SJE298M on 21 Feb 2023

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref: TBA
Dear Meng Yan,

FYNA.



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD (SINGAPORE BRANCH)

GIRO AUTHORISATION FORM

Company Name: JUZZ PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Bank Account Details

Beneficiary Name: JUZZ PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
Bank Name / Branch Name: DBS / TAI SENG
Bank Account No.: 1049015394
Bank Code / Branch Code: 7171/104 5
Swift Code DBSSSGSG
Email Address: admin@juzzperformance.com.sg

(For notification of payment details)

Name/Designation/Telephone/Email of Contact person.:

Hanis / Finance Officer / 63850303 / hanis@juzzperformance.com.sg

1 h\e? authorise Lonpac Insurance Bhd to remit all payment directly to the above nominated account.

> D 1127 PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
/ M JEN: 201534963C
5 Kii‘d Bukit A.\ve 4‘ #03-51/52
Aflithorised Signature qém@m%%” S875)

Date: 8 JUNE 2023

Acknowledged by :

Name / Date:
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