Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 May 2023 10:13 AM

To: Ng Mei Yen

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: 2ND REMINDER FINALIZE - SLQ6315X
Hi MeiYen,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $23,147.80 /- with 08 days of repair before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 May 2023 4:04 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2ND REMINDER FINALIZE - SLQ6315X

Hi Rasul

That is missing item.

Thank you
Meiyen

s
Tou

I3 Photo

5L06315X - missing item 1445

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 May 2023 10:09 am

To: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Subject: Re: 2ND REMINDER FINALIZE - SLQ6315X

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content
is safe.

Hi Meiyen,



email me the check item damage photos and supplementary photos as well

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 April 2023 5:44 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: 2ND REMINDER FINALIZE - SLQ6315X

Hi Rasul
Attach finalize report & after repair photos. 8 days

Thank you
MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Wednesday, 15 March 2023 5:14 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Subject: REMINDER FINALIZE - SLQ6315X

Hi Rasul
Attach finalize report & after repair photos. 8 days

Thank you
MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Friday, 3 March 2023 11:56 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZE - SLQ6315X

Hi Rasul
Attach finalize report & after repair photos. 8 days

Thank you
MeiYen



