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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 3:29 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMF5564X YOUR REF: PC4179L DOA: 23/05/2022 TP - PENDING 

PAYMENT *** LKK REF: CS/AIS22005081/Eny3m4

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Internal 
 
Hi Mei Kwan,  
 
Please proceed with DS.  
 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
 
KC Chan 
Assistant Manager 
Claims & Performance Management Department 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and 
/ or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this 
communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 10:31 AM 
To: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg> 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: OUR REF: SMF5564X YOUR REF: PC4179L DOA: 23/05/2022 TP - PENDING PAYMENT *** LKK REF: 
CS/AIS22005081/Eny3m4 
 
Dear KC, 
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Please see attached survey report. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 10:22 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net> 
Subject: FW: OUR REF: SMF5564X YOUR REF: PC4179L DOA: 23/05/2022 TP - PENDING PAYMENT 
 

Internal 
 
Hi LKK,  
 
Fyna, please.  
 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
 
Claims & Performance Management Department 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and 
/ or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this 
communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2023 10:49 AM 
To: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net> 
Cc: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg> 
Subject: FW: OUR REF: SMF5564X YOUR REF: PC4179L DOA: 23/05/2022 TP - PENDING PAYMENT 
 

Internal 

 
Without Prejudice” 
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Your Claim Ref: : SMF5564X 
Our Claim Ref: L2022-00001SL-PC4179L 
  
We acknowledge receipt of your Letter of Demand  received on February 16, 2023. 
  
Our claims specialist, KC Chan is in the midst of reviewing your claim matter and will keep you informed once there is 
any update.  
  
Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at 
claims@allianz.com.sg 
  
Thank you. 
  
Regards 
  
Regards 
  
Shanti. R 
On behalf of KC Chan 
Claims & Performance Management 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
  
  

 
  
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 
 

From: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net>  
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 1:44 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org>; Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net> 
Subject: [EXT] OUR REF: SMF5564X YOUR REF: PC4179L DOA: 23/05/2022 TP - PENDING PAYMENT 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Good Day Sir/Madam, 
 

We refer to the above matter and client’s claim. 

  

Our LOD as per below: 

Cost of Repair S$   6,836.32 (Inclusive GST) 
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Loss of Use S$      941.60 (8 days) 
GIA Search Fee S$           7.45 
TOTAL S$   7,785.37 

  

Kindly confirm the acceptance. 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

Shinah   

Admin Assistant  

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

25 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159097 

DID: +65 6703 8163 

Email: seloshinah@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.subaru.asia 

 
 

 
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or use 
any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The sender does not 
accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


