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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 3:05 PM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: TP DS claim:  Arrange for survey - Acc on 08.02.2023 invlg SGK 7775 K & XE 7083 D

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 2:33 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: TP DS claim: Arrange for survey - Acc on 08.02.2023 invlg SGK 7775 K & XE 7083 D 
 

Internal 

 
Dear LKK  
 
OI non reporting  
 
Name Of Registered Owner........................................................ 800 SUPER WASTE MANAGEMENT PTE LTD 
Company Reg No........................................................................ 198601155H 
Email Address............................................................................. enquiries@800super.com.sg 
Mobile Phone No......................................................................... (Phone) +65-63663800 
 
 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)  
Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 2:31 PM 
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Siew Chin <siewchin@procarcare.com.sg> 
Subject: TP DS claim: Arrange for survey - Acc on 08.02.2023 invlg SGK 7775 K & XE 7083 D 
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Your ref: SGK 7775 K 
Our ref: XE 7083 D 
  
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
  
Siew Chin 
Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
  
Thank you.  
  
Best regards, 
  
  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
 P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 

From: Siew Chin <siewchin@procarcare.com.sg> On Behalf Of Claims 
Sent: Tuesday, February 14, 2023 12:01 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Arrange for survey - Acc on 08.02.2023 invlg SGK 7775 K & XE 7083 D 
 
Dear sir 
 
Please refer to attached and arrange for survey 
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VEHICLE IS NOT  IN WORKSHOP 
 
Regards, 
  
Siew Chin 

Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the 

intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, 

please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. 
 


