Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 17 February 2023 10:35 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: Notice to inspect our client's vehicle SJT3675) and SNB5224L (Allianz)

on 09.02.2023

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 February 2023 9:35 AM

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: Notice to inspect our client's vehicle SJIT3675J) and SNB5224L (Allianz) on 09.02.2023

Internal

Your ref: SJT3675)
Our ref: SNB5224L

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Nora

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

Tel: 6747 7636

Thank you.

Best regards,



Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQ | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olympls gnd Paralymplc Portnar

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 1:39 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcarl76@yahoo.com.sg>; customer.service@allianz.com.my

Subject: [EXT] Notice to inspect our client's vehicle SJT3675) and SNB5224L (Allianz) on 09.02.2023

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

Our client's motor vehicle no: SJT3675J that was damaged as a result of the above
accident, is now lying at our premises/workshop, waiting for repairs to be carried out.

As you are the insurers of motor vehicle SNB5224L, we hereby give you notice to inspect
our client's damaged motor vehicle at our premises/workshop. If your
representative/surveyor does not inspect our client's damaged motor vehicle within the
next two(2) days, we shall proceed to repair our client's damaged motor vehicle without
any further notice and our client will thereafter look to you/your insured for the repair
costs. This is without prejudice to our client's claim for damages, loss of use and
incidental loss.

We attach herewith our estimate cost of repairs and our client's accident report for your
reference.

Please let us have your list of ten panel surveyors for our consideration.

Thank you & Regards,



Nora

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071



