EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 February 2023 10:13 AM

To: peggy; EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: ACCD INLVG SMV5762G AND GBH4314C ON 14/12/2022
Attachments: SKMBT_C224€23022109550.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Thank you for your email.
Hi Lyna,

Pls assist.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 10:04 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCD INLVG SMV5762G AND GBH4314C ON 14/12/2022

Dear Hsiao Tong

We refer to the above matter and claiming against you as follows:

Cost of repair $3,888.00
Loss of use 5 days @$100 per day 500.00
Search fee 2.00

Total $4,390.00



Attach documents and please let us have your reply soon.

REGARDS

PEGGY FOO

NPH AUTO SERVICE

TEL: 67840663

EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com




(MY ) NPH AUTO SERVICE

Block 2005 Tampines Street 93 #01-246,/254 Singapore 528839 Tel: 67840663 (8 Lines) Fax: 67840692
GST Reg No: MX-0869103-NO. Business Reg No:-394773,/00D
E-mail: nphauto@pacific.net.sg

Our Ref :TPOC73/12/22 TAX INVQICE NO. :06848
Date of
Accident Date :14/12/2022
LIM HWEE MENG Policy Number :MP39127
BLK 498M TAMPINES STREET 45 Model -HONDA FREED
#04-496
Date 121/02/2023
LARBOUR CHARGES
DEAR SIR
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT WE HEREBY AGREED TO
REPAIR THE ABOVE VEHICLE AT:
LUM SUM $3,600.00
Nett Total Before GST $3,600.00
Add GST @ %% $28%.00
Nett Total After GST $3,88%00

(Three Thousand and Eight Hundred Fifty Two Only)

NPH AUTO SERVICE
{MANAGER)



12/15/22, 8:50 AM

INSURER ENQUIRY
Find
insurer

Vehicle reg. no.
GBH4314C
Date of Accident

14/12/2022 &

Reset

%

Insurer Enquiry — GEARS

RESULT & RECEIPT

TP Insurer Enquiry

Insurance

Period of Insurance

China Taiping Insurance (Sing...

28/05/2022 - 27/05/2023

Requested By

Requested Date

PEGGY FOO (NPH AUTO SERVI...

15/12/2022 08:49

Payment details

Request Amount: $$1.87

GST Amount: $$0.13

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): $$2

General insurance Association
Records Management Centre
GST Registration No: M400017735




