Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 2:55 PM

To: Ryder Auto workshop; assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SKZ5283A; Our Vehicle SGR933E

Accident involving SGR933E & SKZ5283A On 14 Feb 2023

Categories: HMK

Dear Zeph,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 10:19 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SKZ5283A; Our Vehicle SGR933E Accident involving SGR933E &
SKZ5283A On 14 Feb 2023

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.

This PRS is on a "Direct Settlement" basis, claiming against AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.
Thank you.

Best regards

Zeph

RByder

Auto Pte Ltd

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 / 28, Autohub, Singapore 417921
Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 HP : 90908277
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