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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 9:47 AM
To: Darren Lee

Cc Vanessa Ngoi; Lim Ai Lian

Subject: RE: [Encrypted] Re: Desktop valuation

Dear Ai Lian / Darren,

The valuation of GBL ##61Z is as below:

MV: §72K FS: S60K

As at February 2023

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Lee <darren.lee@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2023 5:24 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Vanessa Ngoi <vanessa.ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>; Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg>
Subject: [Encrypted] Re: Desktop valuation

Hi Celine
Please find attached for vehicle rebate. please check whether you can access on the file

Thanks
Darren Lee

On Mon, Feb 6, 2023 at 4:43 PM Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg> wrote:

Hello Celine
Attached 1 log card.

Please arrange to let us have a desktop valuation.

~ Thank you.

Yours sincerely

Lim Ai Lian



- Assistant Manager
Collections

Credit

- GL: +65 63498330 || DID: +65 65128365

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881

S HLBank

N\ /1 BEST SME BANK
MALAYSIA AWARDS
THE ASIAN BANKER 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022

| # BEST CASH MANAGEMENT BANK
MALAYSIA AWARDS
THE ASIAN BANKER 2021

"/ MALAYSIA's BEST SME BANK = M EXCELLENCE
ASIAMONEY AWARDS 2019 & 2020 - %= LEADERSHII
EUROMONEY

# MALAYSIA’s BEST DIGITAL BANK
ASIAMONEY AWARDS 2019 & 2021

THANK YOU FOR THE TRUST SHOWN IN US

The information contained in this email and any attachment(s) is strictly confidential for information of the
- intended recipient(s) only. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this
email. Please notify the sender immediately and delete this email from your system. HL Bank Singapore does not

accept liability for any unauthorised changes, errors or omissions in this email or viruses transmitted by this email
| orits attachments.

Best Regards

Darren Lee

Collections

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient,
please immediately contact the sender and delete/destroy the message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of

the message by the unintended recipient, or any action or omission taken by such recipient in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.
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~Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Darren Lee <darren.lee@hlbank.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2023 5:24 PM

To:. ‘ Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi; Lim Ai Lian

Subject: [Encrypted] Re: Desktop valuation
Attachments: GBLXX61Z rebate.zip

Hi Celine

Please find attached for vehicle rebate. please check whether you can access on the file

Thanks
Darren Lee

On Mon, Feb 6, 2023 at 4:43 PM Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg> wrote:
Hello Celine

Attached 1 log card.
Please arrange to let us have a desktop valuation.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

Lim Ai Lian
Assistant Manager
Collections

Credit

GL: +65 63498330 || DID: +65 65128365

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881

The information contained in this email and any attachment(s) is strictly confidential for information of the

~ intended recipient(s) only. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this
email. Please notify the sender immediately and delete this email from your system. HL Bank Singapore does not
accept liability for any unauthorised changes, errors or omissions in this email or viruses transmitted by this email
or its attachments.



. Best Regards

Darren Lee

Collections

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient,
please immediately contact the sender and delete/destroy the message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of

the message by the unintended recipient, or any action or omission taken by such recipient in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.



Enqmre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: - Company
Owner ID: Wass
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: GBL1661Z
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 28 Feb 2023
. Vehicle Make: KIA )
" Vehicle Model: K2500 6MT
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2020 i
“Engine No.: D4CBM205187 T
- Chassis No.: KNCSJX76LM7517931
| Maximum Power Qutput: - i
Open Market Value: $17,078.00 i
Original Registration Date: 25 Mar 2021
First Registration Date: 25 Mar 2021
Transfer Count: ' 1
Actual ARF Paid: $854.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amotint: $0.00 )
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 24 Mar 2031
COE Category: C - Goods Ve—};q'iltzte & Bus
i COE Period(Years): 10
| QPPaid: $40,999.00
i COE Rebate Amount: $33,063.00 )
Total Rebate Amount: $33,063.00
Message

i

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Feb 2023

Transfer of ownership or deregistration is not allowed for this vehicle.

HL ®ank
DJ?‘M.

i L
FC. 60



2/7/23, 6:40 PM

Used Kia K2500 Cars | Singapore Car Prices & Listing - Sgcarmart
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sGcarmart LoginSign p
New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Arficles Forum Resources
Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just
$68 until it's SOLD! - ICHENG YONG CREDIT ENTERPRISES PTELTD GROUP OF COMPANIES
Direct Owner i
With over %00 units of ve?icl.cs s
h 3 i pr e sr
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling ;?l%:t:)ﬁiwn j:;g:.‘negs:&r:k“_ | 0= B
[[20 | results/pag
4 vehicles Kia K2500 Any Category Advanced Search G
Make Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Kia K2500 Any Any Any Any Any Any Available
Kia K2500 Single-Cab $59,800 $9,870 /yr 28-Feb-2019 2,497 cc 63,170 km Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Exclusive warranty provided with purchase. Open deck unit. Low mileage done. New paintwork. Original manufacturer upholstery.
Modification of canopy/box services available. Flexible finance option with speedy process. Immediate handover upon loan approval. Fre. PREMIUM AD
Car (S) Pte Ltd
Posted: 06-Feb-2023
Kia K2500 Single-Cab $35,800 $11,550 /yr 15-Mar-2016 2,497 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
1 owner! Free warranty and servicing to assure you! Low mileage! Super affordable and reliable truck you can use for your business.
Flexible loan and cash deal welcomed. We specialize in commercial vehicle. Call/WhatsApp the below sales handphone number now for v... PREMIUM AD
Car (S) Pte Ltd
Posted: 01-Feb-2023
Kia K2500 Single-Cab $48,800 $9,430 /yr 10-Apr-2018 2,497 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Best price in town! 1 owner only! 10 feet lorry. Very beautiful condition. All Loan Available, Down payment As Low As 10%. Call now for
more information.
Posted: 31-Jan-2023
Kia K2500 Single-Cab $42,800 $9,890 /yr 07-Jun-2017 2,497 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
10 feet with box, flexible loan package and high trade in! Call now to view, doorstep viewing available too!
ABWIN (1994) Pte Ltd
Posted: 16-Jan-2023
Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.
Make Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
For old advertisements, view Expired ads results/page
Buy / Rent Cars Sell Your Car Aftermarket Articles General
New Cars For Sale Post an Ad Workshop Directory Car Reviews About Us
Used Cars For Sale Sell by Bidding Aftermarket Products Car Advice Contact Us
Cars For Rent Sell by Consignment Car News Careers
Car Features Site Map

Compare

Follow Sgcarmart.com

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=0&MOD=Kia K2500&RPG=20& VEH=0&AVL=2
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