Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 June 2023 2:25 PM

To: Henry Lee (Ding Auto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto); Celine Chua (Ding Auto)

Subject: RE: CTPI | OD CLAIM - SMT5940U | REF : SNM23D200400/C01 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Henry,

COR $26,141.34 before excess $1250 and GST @ 8 days (subject to insurance approval)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 2:23 PM

To: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding
Auto) <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: CTPI | OD CLAIM - SMT5940U | REF : SNM23D200400/C01 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Henry,

COR $26,141.34 before excess $1250 and GST. (subject to insurance approval)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 9:44 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Lynn Yap (Ding
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Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding Auto) <accounts@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: CTPI | OD CLAIM - SMT5940U | REF : SNM23D200400/C01 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Hi Kenneth,

Attach the undercarriage after the repair photo for your perusal. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Henry Lee
Claims Department

+65 8363 6141 +65 6452 1208
www.dingauto.sg sa0406@dingauto.sg

176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721
Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645

Virus-free.www.avast.com

On Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 9:03 AM Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Henry, | don't see any under carriage new parts photos on the car??

From: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 June 2023 4:25 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Lynn Yap (Ding
Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding Auto) <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: CTPI | OD CLAIM - SMT5940U | REF : SNM23D200400/C01 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Kenneth,

Good day to you.

Kindly refer to the attached before/after paint photos for your
review
and finalization.

Kindly assist us to expedite this finalization asap. Hope to hear
from you soon. Thank you.

Best Regards,



Henry Lee
Claims Department

“wmr Mobile +65 8363 6141 | Office +65 6452 1208

Web www.dingauto.sg | Email sa0406@dingauto.sg
HQ 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721

Branch Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645

o Virus-free.www.avast.com



