Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 9:48 AM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Teo Jie Yang

Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10020437 /JY || Ol- SMX5423A (Black) TP-SGU8472A || Est:
$0.00 || Autobay PL

Attachments: C10020437 - TP (SGU8472A).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP PRS for SGU8472A. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:

Address
Venue: AutoBay Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-11 Autobay @Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Contact: 86186116 (Mr Lim)

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose

BudgEIt Platinum Trusted

DlrEﬂt Service Award
insurance |- feefo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg



auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 8:41 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS Request on 09.02.2023 | | C10020437/JY || : PRI FOR SGU 8472A ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMX 5423A
ON 8.2.2023 OUR REF: CL/230227/T/AB

Dear Sir (Without Prejudice)
We refer to your email.

1. Our client agrees to LKK
Thank you.

Regards

Sally Goh

(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )

Catherine Lim LLC

(Advocates & Solicitors)

12 Eu Tong Sen Street

#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)

Singapore 059819

Tel: 6438 5500

(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 3:08 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: PRI FOR SGU 8472A ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMX 5423A ON 8.2.2023 OUR REF: CL/230227/T/AB

Dear Sir

RE: NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-
ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGU 8472A / SMX 5423A AND OTHERS ON 8.2.2023 ALONG KJE EXIT TO
BRICKLAND ROAD



We are instructed by CHIANG MING CHERNG to notify you of a road traffic accident involving our client’s
vehicle No. SGU 8472A and vehicle No. SMX 5423A driven by you at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to
repair the damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice
whether you/your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle. If we do not
receive any reply from you/your insurer within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair
the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please let us know your appointed surveyor.

Venue: AutoBay Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-11 Autobay @Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Contact: 86186116 (Mr Lim)

Regards

Sally Goh

(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim)

Catherine Lim LLC

(Advocates & Solicitors)

12 Eu Tong Sen Street

#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)

Singapore 059819

Tel: 6438 5500

(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)



