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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 March 2023 4:05 PM
To: Sreedeep s
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJP1215M , YP7087Z  & FBS1904L on 28/1/2023

Dear Sir, 
 
Noted.  
 

From: Sreedeep s <sreedeeps@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 4:03 PM 
To: Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> 
Cc: chewht@lkkauto.com 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SJP1215M , YP7087Z & FBS1904L on 28/1/2023 
 
Ok thanks.  
 
The reason given to me for suspension was because it was considered dangerous driving. 
 
Thanks 
Sreedeep 
 

On 21-Mar-2023, at 15:32, Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> wrote: 

  
Dear Sir, 
  
For both the lorry and motorcycle claim, the repair cost is not finalise till date and shall takes come 
months.  
  
Meanwhile , may we know the reason why your driving licence is suspended pls. 
  
  
Alvin Yit 
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From: Sreedeep s <sreedeeps@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 12:06 PM 
To: Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SJP1215M , YP7087Z & FBS1904L on 28/2/2023 
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Thank you for the update. Can you please let me know the details of the claim by FBS1904L? 
  
Thanks 
Sreedeep 
 
 

On 21-Mar-2023, at 11:39, Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> wrote: 

  
Hi, 
  
Yes , AIG have also received claim from FBS1940L. 
  
  
Alvin Yit 
  

FORMTEAM ADJUSTERS PTE LTD 
Tel: (65) 6509 1788 • Fax: (65) 6509 6221 
52 Ubi Ave 3 #05-46 Frontier , Singapore 408867 
website : www.fta.com.sg 
 
Website: www.fta.com.sg  
<image001.png> 
  
  
  

From: Sreedeep s <sreedeeps@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, March 11, 2023 5:10 PM 
To: Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SJP1215M , YP7087Z & FBS1904L on 28/2/2023 
  
Hi, 
Just wanted an update if you have received any claim from FBS1940L yet? You had 
emailed me earlier that you had received a claim from YP7087Z. 
  
Thanks 
Sreedeep 
 
 
 

On 11-Mar-2023, at 16:52, Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> wrote: 

  
Hi , 
  
May I know your concern pls. 
  
  
Alvin Yit 
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From: Sreedeep s <sreedeeps@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, March 11, 2023 4:45 PM 
To: Alvin Yit <alvinyit@fta.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SJP1215M , YP7087Z & FBS1904L on 
28/2/2023 
  
Hello, 
Has any claim been received from FBS1940L yet? 
  
Thanks 
Sreedeep 
 
 
 
 

On 08-Feb-2023, at 11:15, Alvin Yit 
<alvinyit@fta.com.sg> wrote: 

  
Dear Sir, 
  
We refer to the subject matter which we act on 
behalf of your motor insurer AIG ASIA PACIFIC 
INSURANCE PTE. LTD. 
  
We have received a Property Damage claim from 
the owner of YP7087Z  for losses arising from the 
above mentioned accident. 
  
We shall proceed to negotiate for  settlement with 
the Third Party at best terms. 
  
Please note that your Non-Claim Discount (NCD)(if 
any) will be affected and reduced by 30% due to 
this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a 
NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilised for 
this claim. 
  
Please call us should you require further 
clarification. 
  
Thank you for your kind attention and 
understanding. 
  
Alvin Yit 
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