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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lee Brothers <sales@leebrothers.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 24 April 2023 11:11 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: FW: Re: Accident involving SJE234Y & SMG1608A on 06/02/2023 at Near 593 

Sembawang Road
Attachments: 24042023130753.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Attached is the LOA and my company bank account details are stated below: 
 
• Account Name  -              Lee Brothers Automotive Pte Ltd 
• Bank Name         -       OCBC 
• Account Number -           588-077891-001 
• Bank Code -                       7339 
• Branch Code -                   588 
• Email Address -                 Sales@leebrothers.com.sg 
 
Kindly send us the payment the soonest. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Warmest Regards, 

Xue Ting 

Lee Brothers Automotive Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Autobay, #02-47 

Singapore 417883 

Tel: 65095521 

 
 
On Fri, Apr 21, 2023 at 4:35 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sirs 
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Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$6,200.00 (all in) in full 
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their 
insured arising out of this incident.  

  

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   

  

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 06 Feb 2023.  

  

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 

  

Thank you.  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Lee Brothers <sales@leebrothers.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 6:14 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Re: Accident involving SJE234Y & SMG1608A on 06/02/2023 at Near 593 Sembawang Road 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We confirm the acceptance of the offer. 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Clm Dtl Modified Insured Name: -> LIM SOO KHUAN. Insured ID: -> S7032660D. Claimant's Name: -> ANG SOK
HOON (HONG SHUFEN). Claimant's ID: -> S7926536E.

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Clm Veh Model
Changed (205620) LAND ROVER RANGE ROVER EVOQUE 2.0 TSS (A). [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

3
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Clm Created
Reg No: SJE234Y. Policy No: SP2000689490-01. Acct Date: 2023/02/06. Claim Type: TP. Insure
r: Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: Income Insurance Limited (HQ). Work
shop: LEE BROTHERS AUTOMOTIVE PTE. LTD. (HQ)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

5
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2023/02/21 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
10 Feb
2023
13:30

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

7
10 Feb
2023
13:31

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
20 Feb
2023
12:10

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:7056.15:Liability: 100%(BOLA 23).OID REVERSED AND HIT TP PARKED VEHICLE(IN PA
RKING LOT). We seek your mandate at $6,489.75(if claim LOU) / $7,056.15(if claim LOR). TP-M
andate IA had been uploaded in Merimen.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

9
20 Feb
2023
22:06

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2023/02/21. Mandate Remarks: cor5562 lou 400 lor 648 (4 days) l
ta 7.45 total 5969.45- 6217.45

[I] Chan
Kian Chuan

10
20 Feb
2023
22:06

Adj Mandate Set Approved:6217.45:cor5562 lou 400 lor 648 (4 days) lta 7.45 total 5969.45- 6217.45 [I] Chan
Kian Chuan

11
20 Feb
2023
22:08

Clm Registration
Modified Acct Time:16:00:00->00:00:00. [I] Chan

Kian Chuan

12
17 Mar
2023
09:02

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:6700.00:Please be informed that third party rejected our offer at $5,959.45(all-in) and
proposed global sum $6,700.00(all-in).

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

13
22 Mar
2023
14:39

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2023/02/21. Mandate Remarks: cor5832 lou 400 (4 days) lta
7.45 total

[I] Chan
Kian Chuan

14
22 Mar
2023
14:39

Adj Mandate Set Approved:6239.45:cor5832 lou 400 (4 days) lta 7.45 total [I] Chan
Kian Chuan

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2913530 10 Feb 2023
13:30:51

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SJE234Y LIM SOO
KHUAN xx.xx
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