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Re: Review Re-inspection Report & Invoice of Vehicle SML 7016S Ref:
IVS22/1516

Mon 2/27/2023 2:15 PM

Dear Andy,

Enclose amended Adjustment with indicate of Market Value for SML 7016S.

Thank you.

Best Regards, 
Renee | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

From: Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, February 27, 2023 11:44 AM
To: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Cheah, Esther <cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Review Re-inspection Report & Invoice of Vehicle SML 7016S Ref: IVS22/1516
 
Dear Andy,

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2023 9:59 AM
To: Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@lkkauto.com>; Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Cheah,
Esther <cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Review Re-inspection Report & Invoice of Vehicle SML 7016S Ref: IVS22/1516
 
Dear Andy,
 
The valuation of SML 7016S are as below:
 
Market Value     : $130,000.00 (est)
LTA Rebate         : $57,780.00 (est)
Nett Value          : $72,220.00
 
Best Regards,

Shi Ch (M ) | C H dl

RS Renee Sia (LKK Auto)     
To: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg> +1 other
Cc: SUR
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