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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 4:10 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Jiayu@mova.com.sg
Subject: RE: SMH2079P

Hi Veron, 
 
Confirm Thank you. 
 
Best Regard's 
Billy Liaw 
 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 62623377 
Fax: +65 62643151  
 

 
 

Connect with us on  
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 2:38 PM 
To: Edward Lim (LKK Auto) <edwardlim@lkkauto.com>; Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMH2079P 
 
Dear Billy, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $4074.90 before excess $600 with 4 days of repair, 
subject to their approval.  
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 11:14 AM 
To: Edward Lim (LKK Auto) <edwardlim@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SMH2079P 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 11:11 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMH2079P 
 
Hi Veron, 
 
Attach with Estimate and invoice request by Edward. Thank you. 
 
Best Regard's 
Billy Liaw 
 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 62623377 
Fax: +65 62643151  
 

 
 

Connect with us on  
 


