Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 2:01 PM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Charandeep Singh

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10020315 /CD || Ol- SKQ5755C (Grey) TP-SLC6952E || Est:
$0.00 || Goh Lee Hwa Automobile

Attachments: C10020315 TP (SLC6952E).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SLC6952E. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

- our workshop at Blk 5033, #01-255, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2, S 569536, GOH LEE HWA AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
Contact: Mr Eric @ 8348 8858

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Eric Tan <starauto28@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 1:28 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 07.02.2023 || C10020315/CD || Accident Involving SKQ 5755 C (Your Insured) & SLC
6952 E

Hi,

We choose LKK.

Regards
Eric

From: Eric Tan <starauto28@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2023 3:44 pm

To: Customer Care <help@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: Accident Involving SKQ 5755 C (Your Insured) & SLC 6952 E

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Accident Involve SKQ 5755 C (Your Insured) Involving Vehicle No:
SLC 6952 E

We refer to the above mentioned vehicle & to conduct PRI at our
workshop.

The driver of the said vehicle is involved an accident with SLC
6952 E.

SLC 6952 E now at our workshop at Blk 5033, #01-255, Ang Mo
Kio Industrial Park 2, S 569536, GOH LEE HWA AUTOMOBILE PTE
LTD



Kindly contact Mr. Eric 8348 8858 for any arrangement on survey
date and time.

Please contact us if you require further information/assistance.

Thank You.

Regards,

Eric



