Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 9:34 AM
To: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Cc: Finalization; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SNG8165C Finalization

Hi Eric,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair $450.00 /- with 02 days of repair before GST, subject to their approval.

As per my message, kindly forward the resurvey after repair photos

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=~ Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 6 March 2023 11:20 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SNG8165C Finalization

Dear Rasul,

FYNA.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 11:17 AM

To: Finalization <finalization@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: SNG8165C Finalization

Hi
Please confirm our attached adjusted finalize amount.
Thank you

Eric Tan
Autosprint Pte Ltd



