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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 2:43 PM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: TP DS claim:  Re: Our Ref: FBR9331S ,SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI; Your ref: 

SKC2529H; ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO. FBR9331S & SKC2529H 
TOWARDS KAKI BUKIT ROAD AVENUE 6 ON 18TH JANUARY 2023 AT 19:00HOURS - 
NOTICE FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION

Dear Shanti, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 2:17 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Nur Hidayah <hidayah@erzatleemotor.com> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: TP DS claim: Re: Our Ref: FBR9331S ,SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI; Your ref: SKC2529H; ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
MOTOR VEHICLES NO. FBR9331S & SKC2529H TOWARDS KAKI BUKIT ROAD AVENUE 6 ON 18TH JANUARY 2023 AT 
19:00HOURS - NOTICE FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION 
 

Internal 

 
  
Your ref: FBR9331S 
Our ref: 2023 32004777KC-SKC2529H 
  
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
  
Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 
Synergy@KB 23  
Kaki Bukit Road 4 
#01-19 Level 2 Singapore 417801 
E: Hidayah@erzatleemotor.com 
 
Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 
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File: SKC2529H OI.pdf 
Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=d76f984f-55a6-42fd-920a-dc1905e14b71-47558292c0df73af 
Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 2/13/2023 
  
Passwords will be sent in a separate email. 
  
  
Thank you.  
  
Best regards, 
  
  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 

From: Nur Hidayah <hidayah@erzatleemotor.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 8, 2023 12:50 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Erzat Lee <erzat@erzatleemotor.com>; Suria Suria <suria@erzatleemotor.com>; Claim Motor 
<claim@erzatleemotor.com> 
Subject: [EXT] Re: Our Ref: FBR9331S ,SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI; Your ref: SKC2529H; ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR 
VEHICLES NO. FBR9331S & SKC2529H TOWARDS KAKI BUKIT ROAD AVENUE 6 ON 18TH JANUARY 2023 AT 19:00HOURS - 
NOTICE FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
I have attached to you the documents that you have requested in pdf format. 
 
Thank You 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Nur Hidayah 
Administrative Executive 
 
Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 
Synergy@KB 23  
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Kaki Bukit Road 4 
#01-19 Level 2 Singapore 417801 
E: Hidayah@erzatleemotor.com 
 
 
[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it 
and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other 
person. Thank you] 
 
 
On Tue, 7 Feb 2023 at 20:33, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote: 

Internal 

 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sir/Madam 
  
Kindly  provide us your client's  GIA report and the LTA search. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at 
claims@allianz.com.sg 
  
  
Best regards, 
  
  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 

  

  

From: Nur Hidayah <hidayah@erzatleemotor.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 11:55 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <Claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Erzat Lee <erzat@erzatleemotor.com>; Suria Suria <suria@erzatleemotor.com>; Claim Motor 
<claim@erzatleemotor.com> 
Subject: [EXT] Our Ref: FBR9331S ,SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI; Your ref: SKC2529H; ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR 
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VEHICLES NO. FBR9331S & SKC2529H TOWARDS KAKI BUKIT ROAD AVENUE 6 ON 18TH JANUARY 2023 AT 19:00HOURS 
- NOTICE FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION 

  

Our Ref: FBR9331S  

Your ref: SKC2529H 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

CLAIMANT:SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO. FBR9331S & SKC2529H   

TOWARDS KAKI BUKIT ROAD AVENUE 6 ON 18TH JANUARY 2023 AT 19:00HOURS  

NOTICE FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION 

  

We act for        SYAFIQ DANIAL BIN SULAIMI       (“our client”), owner and rider of motorcycle no.    FBR9331S      , in his 
claim for property damage and consequential loss and expense as a result of the above captioned road traffic accident 
involving your insured driver of vehicle no. SKC2529H 

  

As a result of the accident, our client's motorcycle was damaged and he suffered other consequential losses.  

  

Please let us know within 2 working days upon receipt of this notice whether you intend to conduct a pre-repair survey 
of our client's motorcycle.  In the event that you do not respond within the stipulated timeline, our client will proceed to 
repair the motorcycle without further reference to you. 

  

If you wish to conduct a survey, please liaise with Mr Erzat at 9898 3441 & Hidayah at 8952 1184, failing which, we will 
proceed accordingly. 

  

Please note the said motorcycle can be inspected at:  

  

Name of workshop:       Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 
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Address:                       Synergy @ Kaki Bukit 23, #01-18 Kaki Bukit Rd 4, Singapore 417801 

  

Contact details:             Mr Erzat at Mobile no. 9898 3441 & Hidayah at mobile no. 8952 1184 

  

  

 
 

Best Regards, 

Nur Hidayah 

Administrative Executive 

  

Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 

Synergy@KB 23  

Kaki Bukit Road 4 

#01-19 Level 2 Singapore 417801 

E: Hidayah@erzatleemotor.com 

  

  

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it 
and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any 
other person. Thank you] 


