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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 1:18 PM
To: 'Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila'
Cc: 'Hor, Yinrul'; 'Hiew, Chasin'; 'Azlan, Syazairdina'; SUR; 'Claims'
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & 

Undertaking Letter

Dear Yussyuhaila,  
 
We refer to your email below, 
 
The owner insisted to activate the replacement vehicle from the beginning. The repair only start on 14th Feb after approval 
was given by your good self on 13th Feb late afternoon.  
 
May I know, isn’t that replacement car usage is only base on surveyor recommendation? Which is 8days for his case? 
 
Nevertheless, below is the info you request.  

1. The date repair started:  14th Feb 2023 – Parts ordered on same day as well 
2. The date repair stopped to wait for spare parts: The repair is ongoing co-currently while waiting for parts to arrive. 

Not much could be done while waiting from 17th Feb – 22th Feb 2023 
3. The date repair resumes:  Parts just arrive today and repair will resume on 23th Feb 2023 
4. The date repair will complete: 28th Feb 2023 

 
Kindly assist to inform Popular on the extension if granted. 
 
Feel free to contact me shall you requires further information. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards, 
Kee Siang Lim 
Claims Advisor 
 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 
p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  f. +65 6841 1183  
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 
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This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
 
 

From: Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila [mailto:Yussyuhaila.Amran@aig.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 February 2023 11:08 AM 
To: Claims 
Cc: Hor, Yinrul; Hiew, Chasin; Azlan, Syazairdina; 'SUR' 
Subject: RE: RE: RE: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & Undertaking Letter 
 
Dear Kee Siang, 
 
I have spoken to insured this morning and clarify on his issue. 
 
He mentioned that the repair has started a few weeks back however repair was stopped due to waiting for spare parts. He 
also expressed his dissatisfaction that the repair started without waiting for spare parts and caused this LOU extension. 
 
He understood that the replacement car can only be used during repair period, and he is willing to pay for extension but 
only on the days where the car is not under repair (including the days where the repair stops for spare parts unavailability). 
 
Since the repair was stopped in the middle, he needs a clear breakdown on the dates where he needs to pay for 
replacement car, as well as the expected timeframe for spare parts to arrive (see below). 
 
Please assist to provide below details: 

5. The date repair started:  
6. The date repair stopped to wait for spare parts:  
7. The date repair resumes:  
8. The date repair will complete:  

 
Please also assist insured to extend his replacement car, if needed. 
 
Thank you 
Noor Yussyuhaila 
AIG 
Claims Adjuster I 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 68307871 
 
yussyuhaila.amran@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 17 February, 2023 5:56 PM 
To: Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila <Yussyuhaila.Amran@aig.com> 
Cc: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; Hiew, Chasin <Chasin.Hiew@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina 
<Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: RE: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & Undertaking Letter 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Yussyuhaila,  
 
Please be informed that policy holder dispute on usage of replacement vehicle. Surveyor has recommended 8 days for the 
repairs. 
 
He has taken the replacement vehicle and it will be ending on 22/2/2023. However, parts for his vehicle will only arrive that
and his vehicle will not be ready before 22/2/2023.  
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He mentions that he had contacted AIG call center and was advice that his usage of replacement of vehicle will be covered 
full period after parts arrives.  
 
Kindly assist to contact the policy holder to clarify on this as I understand usage is only base on the days recommended by 
surveyor. 
 
Best Regards, 
Kee Siang Lim 
Claims Advisor 
 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 
p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  f. +65 6841 1183  
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
 
 

From: Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila [mailto:Yussyuhaila.Amran@aig.com]  
Sent: Monday, 13 February 2023 3:25 PM 
To: Claims 
Cc: Hor, Yinrul; Hiew, Chasin; Azlan, Syazairdina; 'SUR' 
Subject: RE: RE: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & Undertaking Letter 
 
Hi Team, 
 
Kindly be informed that we have approved the claim in merimen. 
 
Thank you 
Noor Yussyuhaila 
AIG 
Claims Adjuster I 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 68307871 
 
yussyuhaila.amran@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February, 2023 7:08 PM 
To: Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila <Yussyuhaila.Amran@aig.com> 
Cc: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; Hiew, Chasin <Chasin.Hiew@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina 
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<Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & Undertaking Letter 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Claims Team,  
 
Attached above as per your request. Kindly assist to confirm coverage urgently. 
 
Best Regards, 
Kee Siang Lim 
Claims Advisor 
 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 
p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  f. +65 6841 1183  
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
 
 

From: Noor Amran, Noor Yussyuhaila [mailto:Yussyuhaila.Amran@aig.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 1:02 PM 
To: Claims 
Cc: Hor, Yinrul; Hiew, Chasin; Azlan, Syazairdina; SUR 
Subject: OD / SKL1173J / 6419806278SG - Request for Police Report, IV form & Undertaking Letter 
 
Hi Team, 
 
Kindly assist to request police report from insured for our further review as there is injury with 3 days MC reported by TP. 
 
Please also request for interview form and undertaking letter. 
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Thank you 
Noor Yussyuhaila 
AIG 
Claims Adjuster I 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 68307871 
 
yussyuhaila.amran@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email 
and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email 
and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email 
and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


