
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN) 

Vehicle NNo (Insd veh) Model MW 5)0 M SPUYF 
SHO223Sc (TP veh) 

Date of Accident o 3 

Global Sum Settlement YES O NO 

% (Agreed/Assessed) Liability 

:$ /0,195 31 
|$ 1214 43 

Repair Estimate 

Final Repair Cost 

S 360 00 2 days at $I0 per day Loss of Use 

Rental (if any) days at $ (incls of GST) per day 

Others 

Final Settlement Sum 

Remarks 

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown 

1 :S 1214.43 FiMul 
2 of ue 

LTA Seavcn fe 3) 2 15 
4) 



MOTOR EDGEVANTAGE PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Autocity #03-01/02, Singapore 575722 Cs 201534758N 
+65 6453 7683 clientservices@edgevantage.com www.edgevantage.com 

Tax Invoice 
India International Insurance nv No. INV23020220 

SJA8991M 
B.M.W. 5201 M-SPORT SALOON M-HYBRID AUTO 

22 Feb 2023 
Wj2302073 

Involce Date 

Ref 
India International Insurance 
64 Cecil St, #04, #05 1OB Building 
Singapore 049711 

Terms COD 
Mechanic Chun Hao Ng 

Mlleage In 
Cash Card ($) 

13688 KM 
Tel: 93683086 

NII 
Email: huihong.yeo@gmail.com 

Attn: Yeo Hui Hong (93683086) 

Description Qty UOM U/P Amt 

1 BMW xenon headlamp RH 5-series G30 CLAR 1.00 PCS 4,000.07 4,000.07 
2 BMW front bumper lower grille RH 5-series G30 CLAR 1.00 PCS 258.90 258.90 

3 BMW front bumper assembly 5-series G30 CLAR 1.00 PCS 1,795.69 1,795.69 
To replace, remove front bumper, headlamp, front bumper 
lower grille & cover 

4 1.00 250.00 250.00 

To putty, reshape and repaint front bumper including 
Supplying of paint materials and consumables 

1.00 280.00 280.00 

To check wiring, connector, programming system & reload 

headlamp software 
1.00 100.00 100.00 

7 B268 coating for front bumper 1.00 0.00 0.00 

8 BMW front bumper lower grille cover RH 5-series G30 CLAR 1.00 PCS 0.00 0.00 

This is a computer generated Invoice. No Signature is required. Subtotal: S$ 6,684.66 
GST 8.0% S$ 534.77 

Total S$ 7,219.43 
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT 

, Yeo Hui Hong_("the third party Claimant") 

of 11A Mount Sinai Lane #03-01(address), 
owner of SA8991M (vehicle no.) 

hereby authorize Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd ("The workshop") 

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and /or loss of use 

("claim") for my Vehicle No. SJA8991M that was damaged 

pursuant to the accident which occurred on 31/01/2023 (date) 

Glentrees Condo car park (location) 

involving Vehicle No/s SHD2238C ("accident"). 

I further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to settle my above 

mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive 

payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the 

workshop. 

Ifurther acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without 

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ owner/ insurers of the other 

vehicle/s is concerned. 

Date:01 (day) of 02 (month) 2023 (year) 

MOTO 

Signed by "the third party claimant" Signed by "the workshop" 



Message preview 
Reply Reply all Forward Delete Print Archive Mark More Previous Next 

RE: RE: RE: SJA8991M Claim against SHD2238c *** LKK REF: CC4/123001290/pa3 X Com.. 
From Hsiao Tong.(LKKAuto) 

To mandy.neo@edgevantage.com 
Mail Cc Admin A 

Date 2023-02-09 17:40 

Summary Headers Contacts 

Without Prejudice 

Calendar 
Dear Sirs, 

Settings We refer to the above matter. 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both part ies, the 1lability is clear under BOLA (subject 

Dark mode to BOLA guidel ine settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above nent loned case. 

? Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisat ion of repair to your client's 

vehicle and admission of any 1iability to our Insured's part. The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages 

according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR Will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by 

our surveyor and approved by our principal. 

About 

Logout 
Thank you. 

Webmail 
Home 

"Kindly note that thís negotiation between partiess on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention 

of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabi lity, what soever, should be 

deemed inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on 
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. " 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197| Email: thewht@lkkauto.con 

HQ: Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(408933) 

--Original Message-----
From: mandy.neo@edgevantage. con <nandy.ngea@ed gevantage.com 

Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 9:38 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@]kkauto.com> 
Subject: Fwd: RE: RE: 5JA8991M Claim against SHD2238C *** LKK REF: CC4/III23001290/pa3 

Good Morning Hsiao Tong 

Please advise on the liability for the above vehicle. 

heard from you soon 

Best Regards, 

Mandy Neo 



SC1E23210003/ Chern's CustomCrat 
ENTRY DATE& TIME: 01/02/2023 17:11 (SGT) SUBMITTED BY: LIng Xlao Jing 
VERSION: 1 (01/02/2023 17:11 (SGT)) 

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT 
IMPORTANT NOTICE 
1. Please report corecly the detalls of the accident to speed up the dlaims process. 2. Thls Form must be completed by Iha Policyholder andlor the Actual Driver policy 3. Informalon liability. provided must be as truthful and accurate aa possible. Any wilful miarepresentatlon or witholding of materlal facts may allow insurance companies to repuolae 

4. The lssue and acceptance of this Form by insurence companies is not an admisslon of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies. 5. Any falsa reporting may be referred to the Polica for investigatlaon. 6. This repor will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Aseoclatlon of Singapore (GiA) for archiving 
and that copies of this report wil, for a fee, be made avallable upon application by interested parties. 7. By the lodgement of this report lo the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable aforesald. 

ACCIDENT STATEMENT 

Date of Submission 
01/02/2023 17:11 (SGT) 
Both Policyholder and Actual Driver 
31/01/2023 10:45 (SGT) 
Singapore 
GLENTREES CONDO CAR PARK 

Reported byy 
Date of Accident 
Exect Location of Accident 

Additional Location Information 
Country/State of Loss 

Singapore 

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE 

Vehicle Registration Number 
SJA8991M 

INSURED/POLICYHOLDER 

Is company? 

Name Of Registered Owner No 

YEO HUI HONG NRIC No 
S7237026.J Email Address 

HUIHONG.YEO@GMAIL.COM 
(Phone) +65-93683086 

Mobile Phone No 

Alternative Phone No 

VEHICLE PARTICULARS 

Manufacturer 
BMW Model 
520i Variant 

Exact purpose for which vehicle was being used at time of 
accldent 

Private use Are you claiming under your own insurance policy for repair to 
your vehicle? 
Vehicle Category No Claiming third party 

Private car Transmission 
Auto CC 
1998 

INSURANCE COMPANY 

Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Name of Insurance Company 
Policy Number/ Cover Note Number 

MT/01049598 

DRIVER 

Name of Driver 
YEO HUI HONG NRIC No 
S7237026J Date Of Birth 
10/10/1972 Occupatlon 
Indoor 

Accident report SC1E23210003 
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Date Of Drhving Pass 

Driving experlence 
Gender 

12/10/1992 
30 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS 

Male 
Mobile Number 

(Phone)65-93683086 AIt. Phone Number 
Email Addre9s 

HUIHONG.YEO@GMAIL.cOM 
11A MOUT SINAI LANE #03-01 

Address 
Address complement 
Postcode 

277050 
Is the driver the policyholder? 
f No, Relauonshlp of the Drlver with the Insured 
Does Driver Own Other Vehicles? 

Yes 

No 
Vehicle Registration Number of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver 

Insurance Company of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver 

GENERAL INFORMATION OF THE ACcCIDENT 

Type of Accident 
Weather Conditions 

Hit and run/Vandalism/ Demaged whilst parked 
Clear 

Road Surface 
Dry 

OTHER INFORMATION 

Was any foreign vehicle involved in the accident? 
Number of vehicles involved in the accident 

No 
2 

Was anybody injured in the Accident? 
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by ambulance? 
Was any other vehicle or property damaged? 
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 
Has the driver been approached by unknown person(s) 
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance? 
Translators name 

No 

Yes 
0 

No 

Translator'sID 
Translators phone number 
Translators email 
Original language used in the statement 

DETAILS OF POLICE ACTION 

Was the accident reported to the police? 
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? 
f yes, against whom? 

No 
No 

CIRCUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT 

REFER TO ATTACHED 

ATTACHMENT(S) 

Are accident photos available 
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? 

attachment? Yes 
No 

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1 

Vehicle Registration Number 
Vehicle Manufacturer 

SHD2238C 

Vehicle Model 
Vehicle Variant 
Vehicle Colour 

Vehicle Category 
Taxi 

Name of Driver 
Contact Number 

(Phone) +65-82000007 

Accident report SC1E23210003 
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Address 

Address complement 
Postcode 
Ineurance Company Name 
Nature Of Damage 
Details of property damaged in accident 

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver) 

Accident report SC1E23210003 
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SKETCH PLAN 

SKETCH PLAN 
VEHICLCCiOEN DATE OF AcCIDENT: IMPORTANT NOTICE 

1. Pieaso roport gorreatly the delails of he sccdent to speod up the oaims process. 
2This Furn musl bo gomelated by tha Pollavholder andlor the Autherlaed Orlver 
3. Irnkor maion providad musl be ae iuthful and aceurate an pesmlble, Any willud miaraprosentation or w dnhoidng of mater.al fauts may 

allow insurRNce companius lo reoudiate polleylinbllily 
4. Tho suo ond acceptanco ul hs Form by Inautance companiea is not an adrlssion of policy lobility on pe part of ine insurarce 

companles 
5. Any lals9 rAPerina may bo referred to the Pollea lor Inveatlaatlen 
6. The report wabo lorw ardad by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Contre established by Ihe General Insurance Assocaahon 
ol Singapore (GA} lor archivng and thaj copies of ths roport w M for a fee be mado mvnlinble upon apphcntion tby interesind pariw. 

7. By the lodyemoni of ihis rapoit lo Uhe inourors, you hereby consont to the nrchiving of thisn raport at he centrm and tu copios of the 

rport boing mada avainbla aforoeoid. 

8. Consent under the Personal Oata Prote ctlen Act(PDPA} 

lunderstand, ncknow ledgu. agroo and oonaent that: 
(a) My insurer , my w orkshop and lho Gonerol Inauranee Arsociation of Singapora ("GIA") may/are parmitted lo collecd. use. dincio0s 
andlor process my parsonal dola/personal Intormndon sot out n ths form) and any oher persongl informatlon provided by mo or 

poSsussed by my insurer (colectlvely the "Poraonal Informallon") and disclos0 and transfer such Parsunal Inlormoion to nl ina.urar(s) 
who have insured vehiclets) involv»d in this acoldunt fall insurorts) w ho hove insurud vehiclo(s} invotved in tis accidert shal bve 
collecively relerrod to ns tho "Insurers"), Iho Ineurors' law yernlaw frms, Iho Monetary Authority of Singapore and any rolovant 

gOvernment agencyaithorily (auch as the polce). for lheu purposots) of 
0) processing, honding and/or dealing w ih my claims induing the sutlernent of the doims and any necessary invuskyalors roabng lo 
the cloims: 

(investigating the accident andor my oleim; 
) carying out and'or dealing w ith my inaructions or tesponding to any enquiries by me: 

( adminiatering my c'aims (ineluding Uhe mailing of correspondenco, statemonts, involcas, renorts or notces to mo wnich coud invo've 
discdosure of cerlain peisonnl data nboiul moto bing about dolivory of the same as w efl as on tho eutorrnl cover of arvelopes/m 

packages). andtor 

( complying w ith appicabie law in administering. processing. handling andlor dealng w ilh my claims 

(colle ctively tho "Purposes") 
(b) alinsurer(s) w ho havo insured velicde(o) invalved in ihis acaidant and Ihe Insurors' lawyorsaw Grms may/are perrtled to colost 
use, dscos0 andlor process my Porsonal information for one or more of the above Purposes, and 

(c) my Personal Inlormalion maylcan be diucdosed by any ol the Insurers andfor GlA lo thoir Ihrd paity servica providers or agons 
Onctuding thair law yersilau frms). w hich my bé alled outside of Singapore, for ono of more of the above Purposes. 

Policyhalder's Signaluro / Dato & 
Time3T E�a zolL 

Driver's Signature i driwor is nol the poicyholdor)/ Dato 
&Time 

itnassed by Resorting Contre 
Paisonnel 

Sketch Plan 3+0HRS 

A 

CRACK 
DVnAE 
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SKETCH PLAN N2 

Date of Accident: 31 Jan 2023 (Tuesday) 
Location: Glentrees Condo Car Park 

Time: 10.45 to 11 pm 

ACCIDENT REPORT 
At about 10.45pm, I was notifled at my hone, by nty condo security guard and Tom (taxl uriver of 

SHD2238C) that an accident occurred invoving my vehicle SIA8991M at thee car park. 

I went to the car park with them and noted the damage to right front of my car, visibly on the 

headlight, grille vent and bumper 

The taxi confessed that he had parked his vehkle aside mine, and he had knocked into my tar 

causing the damage. He is willing to bear the repair costs. 

Yeo Hui Hong 

Owner of SiA8991M 

&Accident report SC1E23210003 
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Back to OneMotoring 

Land TransportAuthority 

Land Transport Authority 

10 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575701 
GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2 

Print Date/Time: 03 Feb 2023/ 17:06:15 

Receipt 03 Feb 2023 
Date/Time: 17:06:15 

Tax Invoice/Receipt 
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-230203-002957 

Previous Receipt No. 

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount 
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST 
No. GST (S$) (S$) (S$) 

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHD2238C 

As at 31 Jan 2023/00:10:45 

Insurance Co: INDIA INTL INS PTE LTD 

Insurance Enquiry SHD2238C 

Enquiry Fee 

1 

24.77 1.98 26.75 
20230203170350909055 

Sub-Total 24.77 1.98 26.75 

Total Before Rounding 24.77 1.98 26.7 

Rounding Difference 0.00 

Total Amount Payable 26.75 

Paid By 

526471XXXXXX2606 eNETS Credit Card 26.75 
Total 26.7 

Cash Change 0.00 

Tendered Amount 26.75 

Excess Refundable 
0.00 

Amount 

THANK YOU AND HAVEA NICE DAY! 

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment 

service provider financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void 

and late fee may apply. 



CS-M 

PAINT PROTECTION WARRANTY 
Thank you lor choosing our product. 

This Agreement (the guarantee s mode this 16 una 2021 (The application date) between Uniaua Ca Bequty Shon (The Company) whose addres1 SNUDLAYa 
LPaya Ubl IndustrialPark f01-40. Singanore 40894 and the customer you). whose detolls are shown below, 
WHEREAS 
(1) The guarantee k supplemental to the sale to you by CS-I Dealeship Process the treatment") to your vehlicle on the appllcalion date and for the 
consideratlon of the Sum pold lor the treatment (the treatment price) (2) The company has ogreed to guarantee the due performance of the above process In Iho manner to the extent as listed below, 

The company hereby ogree with you: 

1.The 3 Year guorantee or part hereof (CS4I Palnt Protectlon System Process) 
aYou complete and send to Ihe compony the guarantee registraton fom wilthin fourteen days of the applicallon. 
b. fwithin 36 months of the applicalon date of the CS-I Palnt Proteclon System to your vehlcle, yoU nolly Ihe company in wriling that your vehlcle has suffered subsequent deterloratlon to lts paintwork by reason of lading. climaticolly Induced crocking or loss ol gloss. c. The other condillons contaned herewith are satisled then Ihe company wMl rereat the applcation at no cos, 

2. Your Stavtony Mghts 
The Guardntee 5 not ntended to reploce, modlly or bea substltute tor your statutory rights and the company shal not be responsible for any loss, damage, cos, 
expenses OR ofherwise which may be Incumed as a drect or indrect resull of your purchase of the treaiment. 

3. Aslgnment of the Gvaraniee (C-I Palnt Protecilon Syoem Procen) The Guarantee is only vald if the cor transfemed from owner to owner. Cor Agent to owner transfers ore not volld under our Guarantee. 

4. Regular Inapections 
in order fo malnfaln your palnt preservation ot Is optimum level, an annual Inspectlon Is recommended. This Inspection is normaly camed out af your supplylng dealer. If there are any major marks or scratches on the paintwork, detailk should be noted on the ouarantee. The CS-l dealership, af Its own dscretilon, is entilled lo request any inspectlon/grooming fee on each Inspectlon and you are ehiltled to enquire whether any Such lee wll be charged and what the lee will be when you present yoUr vehicle for inspection af the dealership. In the event thot you wish to rey on this Guorantee to reclaim the freatment price, you will need to presenf lo the 
company a duly completed Guorontee Cord for the period of time from the applicotion date fo the date that you notily the company. 

5. Umltalons of lably for the company (CS-Il Palnt Proteclon System PrOces) a. The reatment must be oppled at a CSl approved dealership for the guarantee to be valld. 
b. There must be no evidence of color fading. faking or climatically Induced cracking prior to the process being opplied. C.Any oreas repaired or replaced though acident or damage must be retreated Immedlotely by an authorized CS-l deoler and he detll noted 

on the guarontee. 
d. The guarantee shall be invalidated by reason of the folowing: 

Vandalsm: Any evldence of delberate octs or omisslons 
I. Stone Chip: Damage to the Vehicle by any force capable of breaking the treatment's surface le. pebbles, large stones, pleces of rock 
or other simlar objects. 
. Acidic Stains: Bird poo, ree sap. acid rain, petroleum, etc must be washed off immediately or within 24 hours. othenwise etching or 
discoloration may occur. Failure to do this likely to invalidate the guarantee on our Inspection. No point finish, however good, can withstand 
fhe prolonged effecs ol such coTosive matter. 

4.Important Notes 
Old and dirty chamois leathers can cause streaks and other unslghtty marks on otherwise perfect palntwork (especialy on dark coloured vehicles). Such leathers and 

other dyeing/polishing cloths shouid be discarded and replaced on a regular bas5. Regular use of mechanical car washes and jet washes wil eventualy damage he 
sealont. 

Before any guarantee work is camied out. pemission must be obtained from the company. The interior and exterior vinyl cleaner as well as leather treatment are 
Ovailable as ophional exros. It should be noted that due to fhe nature of these materials no guarantee applies. fa claim ls made on the Guarantee, the onginal 
guarantee certificate and number must be given to the company to confimm validity. 

7. How to Make a Clalm 

To submit a waranty claim, yoU must SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL WARRANTY CARD AND ORIGINAL RECEIPT (or other proof of purchase acceptable lo CS-I Paint 
Protection) for the product, along with a detaied description of the defect, to the authorze dealer from whom the product was purchase. All worranty cloims must be 
approved by CS-l prior to commencement of any waTanty serice. 

YOU MUST COMPLETELY FILL OUT AND RETAIN THIS WARRANTY CARD AND RESENT , 
TOGETHER WITH PROOF OF PURCHASE, TO VALIDATE YOUR WARRANTY 

Invoice No: UCBS-0000304 

Customer VINCAR PTE LTD 64731119 
Infomation 

61 Ubi Avenue 2 #02 -16/17 Automobile Megamart 408898 159929 

Vehicle #X17269 BMW 520i White Treatment 16/Jun/2021 
Date 

Service B268 Coating-Executive Expire 
Date 

16/Jun/2022 Type 

Technician Fang Yuanzheng & Li Zhen Guang Gloss 
Unit 

9 Warranty 12 months Name Period 

Remarks Extended Ceraninc Waranty (3 months) 
Extended Titanium Warranty (ó months) 
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