Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 3:13 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: CTP Ref: SNM23D200705/C02/TANCHCRE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SNC8009S(OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMN3715Z (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI23001184/Apa3) on
27/01/2023

Categories: HMK

Dear LKK,

Please seek approval before proceeding DS as we are requesting Rental agreement from Insured.

Regards,

Jacqueline Tarv

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel: (65) 63896116 | F:(65) 6224 7175

From: Jacqueline Tan

Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 2:52 pm

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: CTP Ref: SNM23D200705/C02/TANCHCRE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SNC8009S(OlI : CTI - TBA) AND
SMN3715Z (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CT123001184/Apa3) on 27/01/2023
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