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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 2:17 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: REMINDER: OD FINALISATION / DISCHARGED 13FEB2023 / VEH SLZ3447X / ALLIANZ / DOA 27/01/2023

Hi Bryan, 

 

We accepted lump sum repair as $6300.00. 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

 

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

 

 

On Wed, 7 Jun 2023 at 14:11, Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Elise 

  

Parts 5251.00 

+ 10% 5776.10 

Labour 2120.00 

Total 7896.10 

LS 6,300/- 

  

Please forward your LOD to Allianz. 

  

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 11:43 AM 

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: REMINDER: OD FINALISATION / DISCHARGED 13FEB2023 / VEH SLZ3447X / ALLIANZ / DOA 27/01/2023 

  

Hi Bryan, 

  

Please help to finalise this case asap as the vehicle is discharged from our workshop since 13/02/2023, almost 4 months. 

 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

  

  

On Tue, 16 May 2023 at 16:53, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Bryan, 

  

I refer to the above subject. 

  

Please help to finalise this case asap as the vehicle is discharged from our workshop since 13/02/2023. 

  

I have attached our finalisation calculation, check item and after paint photos for your easy reference. 

  

Appreciate that you can reply by this Friday 19 May 2023. 

  

Please feel free to contact me should you require further clarification / questions. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 
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On Fri, 12 May 2023 at 10:41, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Bryan, 

  

Shall we finalise this case? 

  

Since we didn't submit before paint photo, therefore we finalise it as lump sum repair. 

  

The lump sum repair amount that we calculate is $6655.68. 

  

Parts cost = $5636.00 

       +10% = $6199.60 

  + Labour = $2120.00 

        Total  = $ 8319.60 

  lumpsum = $ 6655.68 

  

Appreciate your prompt finalisation. 

 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

  

  

On Wed, 3 May 2023 at 19:04, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Bryan, 

  

Shall we finalise this case? 

 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 
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Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

  

  

On Mon, 24 Apr 2023 at 12:28, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Bryan, 

  

Any update regarding the finalisation? 

 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

  

  

On Tue, 4 Apr 2023 at 13:47, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Elise, 

  

Thank you for the email. 

  

Dear Bryan, 

  

FYNA. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, April 1, 2023 1:07 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLZ3447X - After Paint Photo 

  

Hi Shiau Chan, 

  

Shall we finalise this case? 

 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 

  

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 

  

  

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 18:35, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Shiau Chan, 

  

Enclosed the after paint photo for your reference. 

  

Appreciate your prompt finalisation. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Elise Law 

Claim Executive 
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SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 


