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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, June 16, 2023 10:31 AM
To: Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)
Cc: SUR; AutoInsure
Subject: RE: RE: OUR REF CM086 GBG2064S OD CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE

Dear Xinyu,  
 
We confirm COR $2800 before excess & gst .  
 
Thanks  
Meihong 
 

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 6:23 PM 
To: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: RE: OUR REF CM086 GBG2064S OD CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
Dear Mei Hong, Without prej udi ce We will be advisi ng our Principal the cost of repair of Lump Sum $2,80 0. 00 (be fore exce ss $2, 000 & GST) with 5 days of re pair, subj ect to their approval. Be st Regards, Xin Yu | Ca se Handler LKK Auto Consultants  
 

Dear Mei Hong, 
 
Without prejudice 
 
We will be advising our Principal the cost of repair of Lump Sum $2,800.00 (before excess $2,000 & GST) with 5 days of 
repair, subject to their approval. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Xin Yu | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 12:28 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: RE: OUR REF CM086 GBG2064S OD CLAIM REQUEST FOR FINALISE 
 
 
 
Dear xinyu, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We attached herewith after paint photos for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your confirmation finalised amount soon. 

Thank You. 
 
Regards 
Meihong 
 



2

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628 
mobile: (65) 9743 6363 
e: meihong.lim@autoinsure.com.sg 
 


