Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 May 2023 10:44 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SGQ7661Z - After Paint Photo

Hi Taufikh,

We accepted lump sum repair amount as $850.00, 2 days.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Elise Law
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Fri, 12 May 2023 at 12:19, Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Elise,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $850, 2 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2023 12:05 PM




To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SGQ7661Z - After Paint Photo

Hi Taufikh,

Shall we finalise this case?

The lump sum repair amount that we calculate is $1296.64.

Parts cost = $ 1526.00
-20% =$ 1220.80

+ Labour ='$ 400
Total =$ 1620.80

lumpsum = $ 1296.64

Appreciate your prompt finalisation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law

Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515  Fax: 6748 5015



On Mon, 24 Apr 2023 at 12:30, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

Shall we finalise this case?

We had submitted the after paint photo to you 2 months ago.

Appreciate your prompt finalisation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law

Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515  Fax: 6748 5015

On Fri, 10 Feb 2023 at 18:50, Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,



Enclosed the above photo for your reference.

Appreciate your prompt finalisation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law

Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515  Fax: 6748 5015



