Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 12:40 PM

To: SUR; admin-d; assignments

Cc: Teo Jie Yang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10020165/JY || OI-SLJ9912P (Grey) TP-SMG4212M || Est:
$8,066.10 || HUP MOTOR

Attachments: C10020165.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to survey TP’s vehicle on a Without Prejudice basis.
Please find attached documents, pw is TP’s vehicle number.

Thank you,
-Julie

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 January 2023 6:09 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 28/01/23, INVOLVING CLIENT'S VEHICLE : SMG 4212 M & OUR INSURED : SLJ 9912 P,
ALONG LORONG CHUAN

Dear Sirs,

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, client's GIA report & necessary documents
for your reference & attention.

Kindly assign your panel surveyor (LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd) to survey the client's damaged
vehicle On : 31/01/23 (at 10am to 12pm) As owner waiting, PLease revert & confirm the survey
assignment.

Please revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, As we are looking for direct
settlement.

Best Regards

David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655
Mailing Address :

Hup Motor Trading & Service

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93

#01-120

Singapore 528838



