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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: carworkzws@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, 13 June 2023 2:57 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: URGENT FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G SINCE 

10.02.2023

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

Please proceed to close and we will submit our LOD to Income directly 

 

Thank you 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 13 June 2023 2:48 pm 

To: carworkzws@gmail.com 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: URGENT FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G SINCE 10.02.2023 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Without prejudice 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair limit at LS $4,500.00 before GST with 4 days of repair, subject to 

their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Sunday, June 11, 2023 10:04 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: URGENT FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G SINCE 10.02.2023 
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From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, 11 June 2023 10:03:23 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-B <admin-b@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: URGENT FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G SINCE 10.02.2023 

Dear Taufikh or anyone can assist, 

  

As per e-mail sent on 10.02.2023, 21.02.2023 & 15.04.2023, Kindly revert on the finalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

  

From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 28 May 2023 2:42 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Cc: admin-b@lkkauto.com 

Subject: URGENT FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G SINCE 10.02.2023 

  

Dear Taufikh or anyone can assist, 

  

As per e-mail sent on 10.02.2023, 21.02.2023 & 15.04.2023, Kindly revert on the finalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 
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From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 15 April 2023 3:29 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Cc: admin-b@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G 

  

Dear Taufikh or anyone can assist, 

  

As per e-mail sent on 10.02.2023, 21.02.2023 & 15.04.2023, Kindly revert on the finalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

  

  

From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 12:28 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Cc: admin-b@lkkauto.com; mtcl@income.com.sg 

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G 

  

Dear Taufikh, 

  

As per e-mail sent on 10.02.2023 & 21.02.2023, Kindly revert on the finalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

Thank you 

  

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 
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H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

  

  

From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 21 February 2023 1:42 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Cc: admin-b@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G 

  

Dear Taufikh, 

  

As per e-mail sent on 10.02.2023, Kindly revert on the finalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

Thank you 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 

#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

  

  

From: carworkzws@gmail.com <carworkzws@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 3:59 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FINALIZATION & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR FBQ6681G 

  

Dear Taufikh, 

  

Kindly revert on the finzalization: 

  

COR: $10, 800 (Lump Sum Repair) 

  

Repair Days: 6 Days 

  

Thank you 

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anna Chua 

Carworkz SG Pte Ltd 

Blk 10 Sin Ming Ind Est Sector C 
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#01-08 

Singapore 575645 

H/p: 9876 6876 

E-mail: carworkzws@gmail.com 

  

  


