Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Michael <michaelng@thinkone.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 5:23 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PC7050 & SLB3398E DOA.12.01.2023 mt/1205240-002

Dear, Veron Chen.
Thank you for your email we accept the offer will prepare LOD send to LKK

Regards
Michael Ng

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 4:52 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;
michaelng@thinkone.com.sg

Subject: RE: PC7050 & SLB3398E DOA.12.01.2023 mt/1205240-002

Dear Michael,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $5150/- with 6 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 2:18 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PC7050 & SLB3398E DOA.12.01.2023 mt/1205240-002

From: Michael <michaelng@thinkone.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 2:17:21 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: PC7050 & SLB3398E DOA.12.01.2023 mt/1205240-002

Dear Taufikh,



Enclosed after repaired photos for finalize hope to hear from soonest possible.

Thank you
Michael Ng



