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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 2:10 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team; william.go@shingda.com

Cc: workshop@shingdaleasing.com

Subject: RE: Finalized - XD 5419 M

Dear William, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $4800/- with 3 days of repair, subject to their approval.  
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 5:53 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Finalized - XD 5419 M 

 

  

From: William GO Shaw Chan <william.go@shingda.com> 

Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 5:52:11 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SHINGDA Workshop <workshop@shingdaleasing.com> 

Subject: Finalized - XD 5419 M 

Dear Taufikh, 
  
Please see the attached marked estimate, supplementary estimate, and photos. 
  
Can we close this case repair cost @ lump-sum $4,800.00? 

  
Thank you. 
  

Yours sincerely, 

William GO Shaw Chan 
Senior Motor Claims Executive 
SHINGDA Leasing 
 
M +65 9679 7561 | T +65 6368 8936 (Ext.266) | F +65 6366 1470 | E william.go@shingda.com | W shingdagroup.com 
SHINGDA Building, 10 Kranji Crescent, Singapore 728660 
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Privileged / confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, please notify the sender and delete it immediately. Do not copy, disclose or 
disseminate its contents in any form.  


