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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 13 February 2023 2:26 pm
To: chh3414@yahoo.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK9225H (ALLIANZ) AND SLL9898L AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO 

INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A CARPARK (AMK TECH 1) ON 27/01/2023

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
You Ref: SJK9225H 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS23000912/Upa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK9225H (ALLIANZ) AND SLL9898L AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A CARPARK 
(AMK TECH 1) ON 27/01/2023 
 
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SLL9898L against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver's favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of 
this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If 
you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please 
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by hand to Allianz 
Customer Care Centre. 
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 80287880 or ezlyna@lkkauto.com. 
 
*I am working from home from 30th~17th February 2023.  If you wish to contact me, pls whatsapp call at 80287880 or email. 

 

Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Angela Tan Hong Choo   PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 11:17 AM
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / YOUR RER: ALLIANZ-SJK9225H              OUR REF: 

BMS2023/05/PD0412/DS(RY) (SLL9898L)  DOA: 27.01.2023
Attachments: LOA.pdf; Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd.pdf

Hi Ezlyna,  
 
We hereby confirm acceptance on your offer @$10,241.27. 
 
Kindly let us have the payment soonest. Thank you. 
 
This settlement does not preclude/prejudice the Claimant/Driver/Passenger for personal injury at a later date should such claim arises. 

 
Best Regards, 
ANGELA TAN  
TPR Team 
 
DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1885 | FAX +65 6872 7260  
EMAIL: Angela.Tan@inchcapemotors.com.sg 
Inchcape – Borneo Motors  I  No. 2 Pandan Crescent Singapore 128462 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.toyotasingapore.com.sg  
 

 
Toyota. Always Better. 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.lexus.com.sg   
 

 
Be a fan on our Facebook page and follow us at @Lexus_SG on Twitter. 
 
 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 4:38 PM 
To: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 



2

Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / YOUR RER: ALLIANZ-SJK9225H OUR REF: BMS2023/05/PD0412/DS(RY) (SLL9898L) 
DOA: 27.01.2023 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognise the sender and know the content is safe. 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ SAVE AS TO COSTS Dear Angela, Solely for purposes of ami cable seƩle ment, we are agreeable to re solve the maƩer at S$10,24 1. 27 (all in) in full and final se Ʃlement of all claims y our clie nt has or may have against Allianz  
 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Angela, 
  
Solely for purposes of amicable seƩlement, we are agreeable to resolve the maƩer at S$10,241.27 (all in) in full and 
final seƩlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured arising 
out of this incident.  
  
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm seƩlement by providing a copy of the LeƩer of AuthorizaƟon / Warrant to 
Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
  
Please note that your client’s receipt of the seƩlement sum or seƩlement sums shall consƟtute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or 
our insured as a result of the accident on 27-Jan-2023.  
  
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / seƩlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments consƟtutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
  
*Kindly provide BANK DETAILS to effect payment. 
  
**LOR is $81/day. 
  
Thank you.  
  
Warmest Regards,  
Ezlyna 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
  
is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenƟal and / or privileged informaƟon. If you are not 
the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communicaƟon to others and 
noƟfy the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
  
  

From: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 8:49 AM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER / YOUR RER: ALLIANZ-SJK9225H OUR REF: BMS2023/05/PD0412/DS(RY) (SLL9898L) DOA: 27.01.2023 
  
Hi Ezlyna, 
  
The LOR per day is $75.00 and included GST should be @$81.00, please confirm. 
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Kindly let us have your dv soonest. 
  
Best Regards, 
ANGELA TAN  
TPR Team 
  
DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1885 | FAX +65 6872 7260  
EMAIL: Angela.Tan@inchcapemotors.com.sg 
Inchcape – Borneo Motors  I  No. 2 Pandan Crescent Singapore 128462 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.toyotasingapore.com.sg  
  

 
Toyota. Always Better. 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.lexus.com.sg   
  

 
Be a fan on our Facebook page and follow us at @Lexus_SG on Twitter. 
  
  
  
  

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 9:33 AM 
To: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:OFFER / YOUR RER: ALLIANZ-SJK9225H OUR REF: BMS2023/05/PD0412/DS(RY) (SLL9898L) DOA: 27.01.2023 
  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments 
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. 

Without Prej udice Dear Angela, We re fer to the above maƩ er. We have our principal’s instrucƟon to offer as follows: - 1. Cost of Repair (w/ GST) $ 9, 672. 2 7 2. Loss of Rental (7 day s x $7 5) w/GST $ 567. 0 0 3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.  00 Total  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Angela, 
  
We refer to the above maƩer. 
  
We have our principal’s instrucƟon to offer as follows:- 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 9,672.27 
2. Loss of Rental (7 days x $75) w/GST $    567.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 



4

Total $10,241.27 
  
Please confirm acceptance and E-voucher will follow shortly. 
  
*Kindly amend the amount claim in LOD and forward us a copy.   Rental should include GST.   
  
Thank you. 
  
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna 
  
  

From: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <Angela.Tan@inchcape.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2023 12:54 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: YOUR RER: ALLIANZ-SJK9225H OUR REF: BMS2023/05/PD0412/DS(RY) (SLL9898L) DOA: 27.01.2023 
  
Hi Sir/Madam, 
  
We refer to the attach reference. 
  
Please find attached a copy of our letter of demand for your kind perusal. 
  
We would appreciate if you could revert us with your offer soonest. 
  
Thank you and awaiting for your favorable reply. 
  
Best Regards, 
ANGELA TAN  
TPR Team 
  
DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1885 | FAX +65 6872 7260  
EMAIL: Angela.Tan@inchcapemotors.com.sg 
Inchcape – Borneo Motors  I  No. 2 Pandan Crescent Singapore 128462 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.toyotasingapore.com.sg  
  

 
Toyota. Always Better. 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.lexus.com.sg   
  

 
Be a fan on our Facebook page and follow us at @Lexus_SG on Twitter. 
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Important: This e-mail and all information contained in or attached to it (the "Information"), is for information 
purposes only, may be confidential and/or legally privileged and is the intellectual property of one of the 
companies of the Inchcape group ("Inchcape") or third parties. Access to the Information by anyone other than 
the intended recipient is unauthorised and any disclosure, copying or redistribution is prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete 
the message and any attachments or copies. Inchcape may monitor all e-mail activity and content in 
accordance with UK legislation, to maintain system performance and appropriate business usage. The 
contents of this email may also need to be disclosed under data protection legislation. E-mail transmission 
cannot be guaranteed to be secure or free from errors, omissions, viruses or unforeseen delay. Inchcape 
accepts no responsibility for any such errors, omissions, viruses or delays, and you are advised to carry out 
your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any 
purpose. To the extent that this e-mail is not an official communication of Inchcape, the sender is acting 
neither as an agent, representative nor in any other capacity for or on behalf of Inchcape.  
 
Inchcape PLC is registered in England No. 609782 with its registered office at 22a St. James's Square, 
London, SW1Y 5LP. Version 13  

 

Important: This e-mail and all information contained in or attached to it (the "Information"), is for information 
purposes only, may be confidential and/or legally privileged and is the intellectual property of one of the 
companies of the Inchcape group ("Inchcape") or third parties. Access to the Information by anyone other than 
the intended recipient is unauthorised and any disclosure, copying or redistribution is prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and permanently delete 
the message and any attachments or copies. Inchcape may monitor all e-mail activity and content in 
accordance with UK legislation, to maintain system performance and appropriate business usage. The 
contents of this email may also need to be disclosed under data protection legislation. E-mail transmission 
cannot be guaranteed to be secure or free from errors, omissions, viruses or unforeseen delay. Inchcape 
accepts no responsibility for any such errors, omissions, viruses or delays, and you are advised to carry out 
your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any 
purpose. To the extent that this e-mail is not an official communication of Inchcape, the sender is acting 
neither as an agent, representative nor in any other capacity for or on behalf of Inchcape.  
 
Inchcape PLC is registered in England No. 609782 with its registered office at 22a St. James's Square, 
London, SW1Y 5LP. Version 13  
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> LOW KOK HENG LESMOND. Claimant's ID: -> SXXXX805E. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Clm Veh Model
Changed (205685) TOYOTA SIENTA 1.5 CVT ELEGANCE (A). [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

3
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Clm Created
Reg No: SLL9898L. Acct Date: 2023/01/27. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singapore
Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Borneo Motors
(S) Pte Ltd (Pandan)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

5
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2023/02/09 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
31 Jan
2023
06:59

Adj Mandate Set Approved:5000.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

7
31 Jan
2023
07:00

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
06 Feb
2023
16:41

Adj Adjuster
Assigned MOHD RASUL -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

9
10 Feb
2023
11:34

Clm Registration
Modified Acct Time:17:00:00->00:00:00. [I] Faiz

Rosli

10
10 Feb
2023
11:35

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2023/02/09. Mandate Remarks: Liability cleared - Liability 100% BO
LA 24, while reversing out from carpark lot OI collided onto TP which was travelling straight No TP
Sect 2 Excess

[I] Faiz
Rosli

11
10 Feb
2023
11:35

Adj Mandate Set Approved:5000.00:Liability cleared - Liability 100% BOLA 24, while reversing out from carpark lot
OI collided onto TP which was travelling straight No TP Sect 2 Excess

[I] Faiz
Rosli

12
21 Feb
2023
11:15

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:0.00:Liability 100% BOLA 24, while reversing out from carpark lot OI collided onto TP wh
ich was travelling straight. We seek your mandate at $10,119.02 (if claim LOU) / $10,399.02 (if cl
aim LOR). TP-Mandate IA had been uploaded in

[A] Ezlyna

13
24 Feb
2023
08:23

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2023/02/09. Mandate Remarks: $10,119.02 (if claim LOU) / $1
0,399.02 (if claim LOR)

[I] Faiz
Rosli

14
24 Feb
2023
08:23

Adj Mandate Set Approved:10399.02:$10,119.02 (if claim LOU) / $10,399.02 (if claim LOR) [I] Faiz
Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2905716 31 Jan 2023
06:59:56

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SLL9898L xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=108033655&CFTOKEN=f113d5e132928681-63213139-ADA6-13BD-F4C0E5FAB46141A3&USID=11941&RID=2896120
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=108033655&CFTOKEN=f113d5e132928681-63213139-ADA6-13BD-F4C0E5FAB46141A3&USID=11941&RID=2896120
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=108033655&CFTOKEN=f113d5e132928681-63213139-ADA6-13BD-F4C0E5FAB46141A3&USID=11941&RID=2896120
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=108033655&CFTOKEN=f113d5e132928681-63213139-ADA6-13BD-F4C0E5FAB46141A3&USID=11941&RID=2896120&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1194509%26extid%3D407201%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=108033655&CFTOKEN=f113d5e132928681-63213139-ADA6-13BD-F4C0E5FAB46141A3&USID=11941&RID=2896120
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