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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 1:25 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Shashitharan   PTCBC
Subject: RE: SLM8839J FINAL BILL

Dear Shashi, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $4952.50/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  
 
Kindly forward the before paint photos 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 2:46 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SLM8839J FINAL BILL 
 
Dear Shashi, 
 
 
Kindly forward the before paint photos 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 1:40 PM 
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To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SLM8839J FINAL BILL 
 
Dear Shashi, 
 
 
Kindly forward the before paint photos 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Veron Chen | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 2 February 2023 12:33 PM 
To: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM8839J FINAL BILL 
 
Hi Shashi, 
 
Can forward the before paint photos? 
 
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 February 2023 4:19 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SLM8839J FINAL BILL 
 
 
For your perusal  
 
Thanks 
shashi 
-----Original Message----- 
From: b051776 <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 February 2023 4:07 pm 
To: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: SLM8839J FINAL BILL 
 
 
 
Sent by: [shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg] 
Number of Images: 1 
Attachment File Type: PDF 
 
Device Name: ApeosPort-VI C3371 
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Device Location:  
 


